
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2005 No. 445

The Education (Student Support) (2005 Regulations)
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2005

Amendment of the 2005 Regulations

4.—(1)  Regulation 18 (Grants for Dependants — Childcare Grant) shall be amended as provided
by paragraph (2).

(2)  In paragraph (4)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£114.75” there shall be substituted “£148.75” and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£170” there shall be substituted “£255”.


