Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

9.

2024 No. 86

The Education (Student Finance) (Amounts)
(Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2024

PART 2
Amendments to the Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2017
CHAPTER 2

Financial support

. In regulation 16—

(a) in paragraph (3)(a), for “£4,215” substitute “£4,175”;
(b) in paragraph (3)(b), for “£4,785” substitute “£4,825”;
(c) in paragraph (4)(a), for “£2,175” substitute “£2,150”;
(d) in paragraph (4)(b), for “£2,325” substitute “£2,350”.

. In regulation 19—

(a) in paragraph (3)(a), for “£4,785” substitute “£4,825”;
(b) in paragraph (4)(a), for “£2,325” substitute “£2,350”.

. In regulation 24(3)(a), for “£33,146” substitute “£33,460”.
. In regulation 26(3)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£3,322” substitute “£3,353”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£3,322” substitute “£3,353”.

. In regulation 27—

(a) in paragraph (7)(a), for “£187” substitute “£189”;
(b) in paragraph (7)(b), for “£321” substitute “£324”;
(c) in paragraph (9)(a), for “£144” substitute “£145”.
In regulation 28(2), for “£1,896” substitute “£1,914”.

10. In regulation 43—

(a) in paragraph (2)(i), for “£6,277” substitute “£6,336”;
(b) in paragraph (2)(ii), for “£11,357” substitute “£11,465”;
(c) in paragraph (2)(iii), for “£9,667” substitute “£9,759”;
(d) in paragraph (2)(iv), for “£9,667” substitute “£9,759;
(e) in paragraph (2)(v), for “£8,108” substitute “£8,185”;
(f) in paragraph (3)(i), for “£5,683” substitute “£5,737”;
(g) in paragraph (3)(ii), for “£10,342” substitute “£10,440”;



Document Generated: 2024-03-09

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(h) in paragraph (3)(iii), for “£8,408” substitute “£8,488”;
(i) in paragraph (3)(iv), for “£8,408” substitute “£8,488”;
(j) in paragraph (3)(v), for “£7,511” substitute “£7,582”.
11. In regulation 45—
(a) in paragraph (1)(b)(i), for “£2,980” substitute “£3,008”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(b)(ii), for “£5,585” substitute “£5,638”;
(c) in paragraph (1)(b)(iii), for “£4,752” substitute “£4,797”;
(d) in paragraph (1)(b)(iv), for “£4,752” substitute “£4,797”;
(e) in paragraph (1)(b)(v), for “£3,973” substitute “£4,011”;
(f) in paragraph (1)(c)(i), for “£4,708” substitute “£4,752”;
(g) in paragraph (1)(c)(ii), for “£8,518” substitute “£8,599”;
(h) in paragraph (1)(c)(iii), for “£7,250” substitute “£7,319”;
(1) in paragraph (1)(c)(iv), for “£7,250” substitute “£7,319”;
(j) in paragraph (1)(c)(v), for “£6,081” substitute “£6,139”;
(k) in paragraph (2)(b)(i), for “£2,265” substitute “£2,286”;
(1) in paragraph (2)(b)(ii), for “£4,271” substitute “£4,311”;
(m) in paragraph (2)(b)(iii), for “£3,474” substitute “£3,507”;
(n) in paragraph (2)(b)(iv), for “£3,474” substitute “£3,507”;
(o) in paragraph (2)(b)(v), for “£3,096” substitute “£3,125”;
(p) in paragraph (2)(c)(i), for “£4,262” substitute “£4,303”;
(q) in paragraph (2)(c)(ii), for “£7,757” substitute “£7,830”;
(r) in paragraph (2)(c)(iii), for “£6,306” substitute “£6,366”;
(s) in paragraph (2)(c)(iv), for “£6,306” substitute “£6,366”;
(t) in paragraph (2)(c)(v), for “£5,633” substitute “£5,737”.
12. In regulation 50(1)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£93” substitute “£94”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£179” substitute “£181”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£196” substitute “£198”;
(d) in sub-paragraph (d), for “£196” substitute “£198”;
(e) in sub-paragraph (e), for “£141” substitute “£142”.
13. In regulation 56—
(a) in paragraph (3)(a), for “£4,708” substitute “£4,752”;
(b) in paragraph (3)(b), for “£8,518” substitute “£8,599”;
(c) in paragraph (3)(c), for “£7,250” substitute “£7,319”;
(d) in paragraph (3)(d), for “£7,250” substitute “£7,319”;
(e) in paragraph (3)(e), for “£6,081” substitute “£6,139”;
(f) in paragraph (4)(a), for “£4,262” substitute “£4,303”;
(g) in paragraph (4)(b), for “£7,757” substitute “£7,830”;
(h) in paragraph (4)(c), for “£6,306” substitute “£6,366”;

2



Document Generated: 2024-03-09

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(1) in paragraph (4)(d), for “£6,306 substitute “£6,366”;

(j) in paragraph (4)(e), for “£5,633” substitute “£5,687”.
14. In regulation 88(3)(a), for “£33,146” substitute “£33,460”.
15. In regulation 91(3)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£3,322” substitute “£3,353”;

(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£3,322” substitute “£3,353”.
16. In regulation 92—

(a) in paragraph (6)(a), for “£187” substitute “£189”;

(b) in paragraph (6)(b), for “£321” substitute “£324”;

(c) in paragraph (8)(a), for “£144” substitute “£145”.
17. Inregulation 93(2), for “£1,896” substitute “£1,914”.
18. In regulation 117(2)(a), for “£33,146” substitute “£33,460”.



