Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Education (Student
Finance) (Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2023, Section 25. (See end of Document for details)

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 87

The Education (Student Finance) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2023

PART 5

Amendments to the Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2017
CHAPTER 2
Financial support — uplifts

25. Inregulation 45—
(a) in paragraph (1)(a)(i), for “£2,926” substitute “£2,980”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(a)(ii), for “£5,484” substitute “£5,585”;
(c) in paragraph (1)(a)(iii), for “£4,666” substitute “£4,752”;
(d) in paragraph (1)(a)(iv), for “£4,666” substitute “£4,752”;
(e) in paragraph (1)(a)(v), for “£3,901” substitute “£3,973”;
(f) in paragraph (1)(b)(i), for “£2,926 substitute “£2,980”;
(g) in paragraph (1)(b)(ii), for “£5,484” substitute “£5,585”;
(h) in paragraph (1)(b)(iii), for “£4,666” substitute “£4,752”;
(1) in paragraph (1)(b)(iv), for “£4,666” substitute “£4,752”;
(j) in paragraph (1)(b)(v), for “£3,901” substitute “£3,973”;
(k) in paragraph (1)(c)(i), for “£4,622” substitute “£4,708”;
(1) in paragraph (1)(c)(ii), for “£8,364” substitute “£8,518”;
(m) in paragraph (1)(c)(iii), for “£7,119” substitute “£7,250”;
(n) in paragraph (1)(c)(iv), for “£7,119” substitute “£7,250”;
(o) in paragraph (1)(c)(v), for “£5,971” substitute “£6,081”;
(p) in paragraph (2)(a)(i), for “£2,224” substitute “£2,265”;
(q) in paragraph (2)(a)(ii), for “£4,194” substitute “£4,271”;
(r) in paragraph (2)(a)(iii), for “£3,040” substitute “£3,096”;
(s) in paragraph (2)(a)(iv), for “£3,040” substitute “£3,096”;
(t) in paragraph (2)(a)(v), for “£3,040” substitute “£3,096”;
(u) in paragraph (2)(b)(i), for “£2,224” substitute “£2,265”;
(v) in paragraph (2)(b)(ii), for “£4,194” substitute “£4,271”;
(w) 1in paragraph (2)(b)(iii), for “£3,411” substitute “£3,474”;
(x) in paragraph (2)(b)(iv), for “£3,411” substitute “£3,474”;
(y) in paragraph (2)(b)(v), for “£3,040 substitute “£3,096”;



Document Generated: 2023-10-27

Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Education (Student
Finance) (Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2023, Section 25. (See end of Document for details)

(z) in paragraph (2)(c)(i), for “£4,185” substitute “£4,262”;
(aa) in paragraph (2)(c)(ii), for “£7,616” substitute “£7,757”;
(bb) in paragraph (2)(c)(iii), for “£6,192” substitute “£6,3067;
(cc) in paragraph (2)(c)(iv), for “£6,192” substitute “£6,306”;
(dd) in paragraph (2)(c)(v), for “£5,531” substitute “£5,633”.

Commencement Information
I Reg. 25 in force at 22.2.2023, see reg. 1(2)


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2023/87/regulation/1/2

Changes to legislation:
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Education (Student Finance)
(Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2023, Section 25.




