
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Care and Support (Charging) and
(Financial Assessment) (Wales) (Miscellaneous Amendments) Regulations 2023, Section 2. (See end of Document for details)

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 67

The Care and Support (Charging) and (Financial Assessment)
(Wales) (Miscellaneous Amendments) Regulations 2023

Amendment of the Care and Support (Charging) (Wales) Regulations 2015

2. The Care and Support (Charging) (Wales) Regulations 2015(1) are amended as follows—
(a) in regulation 13 (minimum income amount where a person is provided with

accommodation in a care home), for “£35” substitute “£39.50”;
(b) in regulation 28 (minimum income amount where a person is provided with

accommodation in a care home), for “£35” substitute “£39.50”.

Commencement Information
I1 Reg. 2 in force at 10.4.2023, see reg. 1(2)

(1) S.I. 2015/1843 (W. 271), amended by S.I. 2022/99 (W. 35); there are other amending instruments, but none is relevant.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2023/67/regulation/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2023/67/regulation/1/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2015/1843
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2022/99


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Care and Support (Charging) and
(Financial Assessment) (Wales) (Miscellaneous Amendments) Regulations 2023, Section 2.


