
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the
The Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed Requirements and Default Scheme)

(Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2023, Section 15. (See end of Document for details)

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 47

The Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed Requirements
and Default Scheme) (Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2023

Amendments to the Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Default Scheme) (Wales) Regulations
2013

15. In Schedule 2 (applicable amounts: pensioners)—
(a) in column (2) of the Table in paragraph 1 (personal allowances)—

(i) in sub-paragraph (1) for “£197.10” substitute “£217.00”;
(ii) in sub-paragraph (2) for “£294.90” substitute “£324.70”;

(iii) in sub-paragraph (3) of the English text for “£294.90” and “£97.80” substitute
“£324.70” and “£107.70” respectively;

(iv) in sub-paragraph (3) of the Welsh text for “£294.90” and “£97.90” substitute
“£324.70” and “£107.70” respectively;

(b) in column (2) of the Table in paragraph 2(1) (child or young person amounts), for “£70.80”,
in both places it occurs, substitute “£77.78”;

(c) in paragraph 3 (family premium), for “£17.85” substitute “£18.53”;
(d) in the Table in Part 4 (amounts of premium specified in Part 3), in the second column—

(i) in sub-paragraph (1), for “£69.40” in both places it occurs, substitute “£76.40” and
for “£138.80” substitute “£152.80”;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (2), for “£27.44” substitute “£30.17”;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (3), for “£68.04” substitute “£74.69”;
(iv) in sub-paragraph (4), for “£38.85” substitute “£42.75”.

Commencement Information
I1 Reg. 15 in force at 20.1.2023, see reg. 1(2)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2023/47/regulation/1/2


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Council Tax Reduction Schemes
(Prescribed Requirements and Default Scheme) (Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2023, Section
15.


