Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 73

The Education (Student Support) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2021

PART 3

AMOUNTS OF SUPPORT
CHAPTER 1

AMENDMENTS TO THE EDUCATION (STUDENT
SUPPORT) (WALES) REGULATIONS 2017

Amendments to regulation 45

20. In regulation 45 (students with reduced entitlement)—
(a) in paragraph (1), sub-paragraph (a)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£2,777” substitute “£2,862”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£5,204” substitute “£5,363”;
(iii) in paragraph (iii), for “£4,428” substitute “£4,563”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£4,428” substitute “£4,563”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£3,702” substitute “£3,815”;
(b) in paragraph (1), sub-paragraph (b)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£2,777” substitute “£2,862”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£5,204” substitute “£5,363”;
(iii) in paragraph (iii), for “£4,428” substitute “£4,563”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£4,428” substitute “£4,563”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£3,702” substitute “£3,815”;
(c) in paragraph (1), sub-paragraph (c)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£4,386” substitute “£4,520”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£7,938” substitute “£8,180”;
(iii) in paragraph (iii), for “£6,756” substitute “£6,962”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£6,756” substitute “£6,962”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£5,666” substitute “£5,840”;
(d) in paragraph (2), sub-paragraph (a)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£2,111” substitute “£2,175”;
(i) in paragraph (ii), for “£3,980” substitute “£4,102”;
(iii) in paragraph (iii), for “£2,885” substitute “£2,973”;



Document Generated: 2023-08-11

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£2,885” substitute “£2,973”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£2,885” substitute “£2,973”;
(e) in paragraph (2), sub-paragraph (b)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£2,111” substitute “£2,175”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£3,980” substitute “£4,102”;
(iii) in paragraph (iii), for “£3,237” substitute “£3,336”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£3,237” substitute “£3,336”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£2,885” substitute “£2,973”;
(f) in paragraph (2), sub-paragraph (c)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£3,971” substitute “£4,093”;
(i) in paragraph (ii), for “£7,228” substitute “£7,449”;
(iii) in paragraph (iii), for “£5,876” substitute “£6,056;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£5,876” substitute “£6,056”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£5,249” substitute “£5,410”.



