
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 73

The Education (Student Support) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2021

PART 3
AMOUNTS OF SUPPORT

CHAPTER 1

AMENDMENTS TO THE EDUCATION (STUDENT
SUPPORT) (WALES) REGULATIONS 2017

Amendments to regulation 43

19. In regulation 43 (maximum amount of loans for eligible students with full entitlement who are
2010 cohort students, 2012 cohort students or 2012 accelerated graduate entry students undertaking
their first year of study)—

(a) in paragraph (2)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (i), for “£5,848” substitute “£6,027”;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (ii), for “£10,584” substitute “£10,907”;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (iii), for “£9,008” substitute “£9,283”;
(iv) in sub-paragraph (iv), for “£9,008” substitute “£9,283”;
(v) in sub-paragraph (v), for “£7,555” substitute “£7,786”;

(b) in paragraph (3)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (i), for “£5,295” substitute “£5,457”;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (ii), for “£9,638” substitute “£9,932”;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (iii), for “£7,835” substitute “£8,074”;
(iv) in sub-paragraph (iv), for “£7,835” substitute “£8,074”;
(v) in sub-paragraph (v), for “£6,999” substitute “£7,213”.


