Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 73

The Education (Student Support) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2021

PART 3
AMOUNTS OF SUPPORT

CHAPTER 1

AMENDMENTS TO THE EDUCATION (STUDENT
SUPPORT) (WALES) REGULATIONS 2017

Amendments to the Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2017

13. The Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2017 are amended in accordance with
regulations 14 to 25.

Amendments to regulation 16

14. In regulation 16 (new fee grant)—
(a) in paragraph (3)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£4,530” substitute “£4,395”;
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£4,470” substitute “£4,605”;
(b) in paragraph (4)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£2,340 substitute “£2,270”;
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£2,160” substitute “£2,230”.

Amendments to regulation 19

15. Inregulation 19 (new fee loan in respect of courses beginning on or after 1 September 2012)

(a) in paragraph (3)(a), for “£4,470” substitute “£4,605”;
(b) in paragraph (4)(a), for “£2,160” substitute “£2,230”.

Amendments to regulation 26
16. In regulation 26 (grants for dependants — adult dependants’ grant), in paragraph (3)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£3,094” substitute “£3,190”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£3,094” substitute “£3,190”.



Document Generated: 2023-06-15
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Amendments to regulation 27

17. In regulation 27 (grants for dependants — childcare grant)—
(a) in paragraph (7)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£174.22” substitute “£179.62”;
(ii) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£298.69” substitute “£307.95”;
(b) in paragraph (9)(a), for “£134.70” substitute “£138.81”.

Amendment to regulation 28

18. In regulation 28 (grants for dependants — parents’ learning allowance), in paragraph (2), for
“£1,766” substitute “£1,821”.

Amendments to regulation 43

19. Inregulation 43 (maximum amount of loans for eligible students with full entitlement who are
2010 cohort students, 2012 cohort students or 2012 accelerated graduate entry students undertaking
their first year of study)—

(a) in paragraph (2)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (i), for “£5,848” substitute “£6,027”;
(i1) in sub-paragraph (ii), for “£10,584” substitute “£10,907”;
(ii1) in sub-paragraph (iii), for “£9,008” substitute “£9,283”;
(iv) in sub-paragraph (iv), for “£9,008” substitute “£9,283”;
(v) in sub-paragraph (v), for “£7,555” substitute “£7,786;
(b) in paragraph (3)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (i), for “£5,295” substitute “£5,457”;
(i1) in sub-paragraph (ii), for “£9,638” substitute “£9,932”;
(ii1) in sub-paragraph (iii), for “£7,835” substitute “£8,074”;
(iv) in sub-paragraph (iv), for “£7,835” substitute “£8,074”;
(v) in sub-paragraph (v), for “£6,999” substitute “£7,213”.

Amendments to regulation 45

20. In regulation 45 (students with reduced entitlement)—
(a) in paragraph (1), sub-paragraph (a)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£2,777” substitute “£2,862”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£5,204” substitute “£5,363”;
(iii) in paragraph (iii), for “£4,428” substitute “£4,563”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£4,428” substitute “£4,563”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£3,702” substitute “£3,815”;
(b) in paragraph (1), sub-paragraph (b)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£2,777” substitute “£2,862”;
(i) in paragraph (ii), for “£5,204” substitute “£5,363”;
(iii) in paragraph (iii), for “£4,428” substitute “£4,563”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£4,428” substitute “£4,563”;
2



Document Generated: 2023-06-15

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(v) in paragraph (v), for “£3,702” substitute “£3,815”;
(c) in paragraph (1), sub-paragraph (c)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£4,386” substitute “£4,520”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£7,938” substitute “£8,180”;
(ii1) in paragraph (iii), for “£6,756” substitute “£6,962”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£6,756” substitute “£6,962”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£5,666” substitute “£5,840”;
(d) in paragraph (2), sub-paragraph (a)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£2,111” substitute “£2,175”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£3,980” substitute “£4,102”;
(ii1) in paragraph (iii), for “£2,885” substitute “£2,973”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£2,885” substitute “£2,973”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£2,885” substitute “£2,973”;
(e) in paragraph (2), sub-paragraph (b)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£2,111” substitute “£2,175”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£3,980” substitute “£4,102”;
(ii1) in paragraph (iii), for “£3,237” substitute “£3,336”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£3,237” substitute “£3,336”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£2,885” substitute “£2,973”;
(f) in paragraph (2), sub-paragraph (c)—
(i) in paragraph (i), for “£3,971” substitute “£4,093”;
(i1) in paragraph (ii), for “£7,228” substitute “£7,449”;
(ii1) in paragraph (iii), for “£5,876” substitute “£6,056”;
(iv) in paragraph (iv), for “£5,876” substitute “£6,056”;
(v) in paragraph (v), for “£5,249” substitute “£5,410”.

Amendments to regulation 50
21. Inregulation 50 (increases in maximum amount), in paragraph (1)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£86” substitute “£89”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£167” substitute “£172”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£182” substitute “£188”;
(d) in sub-paragraph (d), for “£182” substitute “£188”;
(e) in sub-paragraph (e), for “£131” substitute “£135”.

Amendments to regulation 56
22. Inregulation 56 (application of contribution)—
(a) in paragraph (3)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£4,147” substitute “£4,520”;
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£7,505” substitute “£8,180”;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£6,388” substitute “£6,962”;

3



Document Generated: 2023-06-15
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(iv) in sub-paragraph (d), for “£6,388” substitute “£6,962”;
(v) in sub-paragraph (e), for “£5,357” substitute “£5,840”;
(b) in paragraph (4)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£3,755” substitute “£4,093”;
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£6,834” substitute “£7,449”;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£5,556” substitute “£6,056”;
(iv) in sub-paragraph (d), for “£5,556” substitute “£6,056”;
(v) in sub-paragraph (e), for “£4,963” substitute “£5,410”.

Amendments to regulation 91

23. Inregulation 91 (part-time adult dependants’ grant), in paragraph (3)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£3,094” substitute “£3,190”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£3,094” substitute “£3,190”.

Amendments to regulation 92

24, In regulation 92 (part-time childcare grant)—
(a) in paragraph (6)—
(1) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£174.22” substitute “£179.62”;
(i1) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£298.69” substitute “£307.95”;
(b) in paragraph (8)(a), for “£134.70” substitute “£138.31”.

Amendment to regulation 93

25. In regulation 93 (part-time parents’ learning allowance), in paragraph (2), for “£1,766”
substitute “£1,821”.



