
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 1490

The Health Protection (Coronavirus Restrictions) (No. 5)
(Wales) (Amendment) (No. 26) Regulations 2021

Amendment to the Health Protection (Coronavirus Restrictions) (No. 5) (Wales) Regulations
2020

2.—(1)  The Health Protection (Coronavirus Restrictions) (No. 5) (Wales) Regulations 2020(1)
are amended as follows.

(2)  In regulation 6—
(a) in paragraph (4), for “10 days” substitute “7 days”;
(b) in paragraph (5), for “10 days” substitute “7 days”.

(3)  In regulation 7—
(a) in paragraph (4), for “10 days” substitute “7 days”;
(b) in paragraph (5), for “10 days” substitute “7 days”.

(4)  In regulation 10B, before paragraph (1) insert—
“(A1)  Where an adult is required to not leave or be outside of the place where the

adult is living in accordance with regulation 6(2) immediately before the Health Protection
(Coronavirus Restrictions) (No. 5) (Wales) (Amendment) (No. 26) Regulations 2021 come
into force, the last day of the adult’s isolation is to be determined in accordance with
regulation 6(4) or (5) as amended by those Regulations.

(A2)  Where a child is required to not leave or be outside of the place where the
child is living in accordance with regulation 7(2) immediately before the Health Protection
(Coronavirus Restrictions) (No. 5) (Wales) (Amendment) (No. 26) Regulations 2021 come
into force, the last day of the child’s isolation is to be determined in accordance with
regulation 7(4) or (5) as amended by those Regulations.”

(5)  In regulation 16(1), under the “Step 4” sub-heading, in sub-paragraph (a)(i), for “has tested
positive for coronavirus in the previous 10 days” substitute “is required to not leave or be outside of
the place where the person is living by virtue of regulation 6(2) or 7(2)”.

(6)  In Schedule 2, in paragraph 4(2)(l)(ii), omit “or extended household”.

(1) S.I. 2020/1609 (W. 335) as amended by S.I. 2020/1610 (W. 336), S.I. 2020/1623 (W. 340), S.I. 2020/1645 (W. 345), S.I.
2021/20 (W. 7), S.I. 2021/46 (W. 10), S.I. 2021/57 (W. 13), S.I. 2021/66 (W. 15), S.I. 2021/95 (W. 26), S.I. 2021/103 (W.
28), S.I. 2021/172 (W. 40), S.I. 2021/210 (W. 52), S.I. 2021/307 (W. 79), S.I. 2021/413 (W. 133), S.I. 2021/502 (W. 150),
S.I. 2021/542 (W. 154), S.I. 2021/583 (W. 160), S.I. 2021/668 (W. 169), S.I. 2021/686 (W. 172), S.I. 2021/722 (W. 183), S.I.
2021/862 (W. 201), S.I. 2021/925 (W. 210), S.I. 2021/970 (W. 228), S.I. 2021/1119 (W. 271), S.I. 2021/1131 (W. 274), S.I.
2021/1212 (W. 303), S.I. 2021/1304 (W. 334), S.I. 2021/1363 (W. 358), S.I. 2021/1407 (W. 366), S.I. 2021/1468 (W. 376),
S.I. 2021/1477 (W. 379) and S.I. 2021/1485 (W. 386).

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2020/1609
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2020/1610
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2020/1623
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2020/1645
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/20
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/20
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/57
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/66
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/95
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/103
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/103
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/172
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/210
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/307
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/413
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/502
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/542
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/583
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/668
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/686
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/722
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/862
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/862
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/925
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/970
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/1119
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/1131
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/1212
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/1212
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/1304
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/1363
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/1407
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/1468
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/1477
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2021/1485

