
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 16

The Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed Requirements
and Default Scheme) (Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2020

Amendments to the Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Default Scheme) (Wales) Regulations
2013

23. In Schedule 2 (applicable amounts: pensioners)—
(a) in column (2) of the Table in paragraph 1 (personal allowances)—

(i) in sub-paragraph (1) for “£167.25” and “£181.00” substitute “£173.80” and
“£187.80” respectively;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (2) for “£255.25” and “£270.60” substitute “”£265.20” and
“£280.85” respectively;

(iii) in sub-paragraph (3) for “£255.25” and “£88.00” substitute “£265.20” and “£91.40”
respectively;

(iv) in sub-paragraph (4) for “£270.60” and “£89.60” substitute “£280.85” and “£93.05”
respectively;

(b) in the Table in Part 4 (amounts of premiums specified in Part 3), in the second column—
(i) in sub-paragraph (1) for £65.85” in each place in which it occurs substitute “£66.95”

and for “£131.70” substitute “£133.90”;
(ii) in sub-paragraph (2) for “£26.04” substitute “£26.60;

(iii) in sub-paragraph (3) for “£64.19” substitute “£65.52”;
(iv) in sub-paragraph (4) for “£36.85” substitute “£37.50”.


