Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 16

The Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed Requirements
and Default Scheme) (Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2020

Amendments to the Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Default Scheme) (Wales) Regulations
2013

16. In paragraph 28 (non-dependant deductions: pensioners and persons who are not pensioners)

(a) in sub-paragraph (1)(a) for “£13.75” substitute “£14.65”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (1)(b) for “£4.55” substitute “4.85”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (2)(a) for “£210.00” substitute “£217.00”;

(d) in sub-paragraph (2)(b) for “£210.00”, “£365.00” and “£9.15” substitute “£217.00”,
“£377.00” and “£9.75” respectively;

(e) in sub-paragraph (2)(c) for “£365.00”, “£450.00” and “£11.50” substitute “£377.00”,
“£469.00” and “£12.25” respectively.



