
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No. 235

The Education (Student Finance) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2019

PART 5
AMENDMENTS TO THE EDUCATION (STUDENT

SUPPORT) (WALES) REGULATIONS 2017

Amendments to regulation 43

24. In regulation 43 (maximum amount of loans for certain eligible students)—
(a) in paragraph (2)—

(i) in sub-paragraph (i) for “£5,529” substitute “£5,684”;
(ii) in sub-paragraph (ii) for “£10,007” substitute “£10,288”;

(iii) in sub-paragraph (iii) for “£8,517” substitute “£8,756”;
(iv) in sub-paragraph (iv) for “£8,517” substitute “£8,756”;
(v) in sub-paragraph (v) for “£7,143” substitute “£7,344;

(b) in paragraph (3)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (i) for “£5,006” substitute “£5,147”;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (ii) for “£9,112” substitute “£9,368”;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (iii) for “£7,408” substitute “£7,616”;
(iv) in sub-paragraph (iv) for “£7,408” substitute “£7,616”;
(v) in sub-paragraph (v) for “£6,617” substitute “£6,803”.


