
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 335

The Benefit Cap (Annual Limit)
(Amendment) Regulations 2023

Amendment of the Housing Benefit Regulations 2006

4. In regulation 75CA(2) of the Housing Benefit Regulations 2006 (determination of the relevant
amount)(1)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£15,410” substitute “£16,967”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£23,000” substitute “£25,323”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (c) for “£13,400” substitute “£14,753”;
(d) in sub-paragraph (d) for “£20,000” substitute “£22,020”.

(1) S.I. 2006/213. Regulation 75CA was inserted by S.I. 2016/909.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/213
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/909

