
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 314

The Medicines (Products for Human Use)
(Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2023

Amendment of Schedule 3

25.—(1)  Schedule 3 (fees for inspections) is amended as follows.
(2)  In paragraph 2(1) (fees: general)—

(a) in paragraph (a), for “£2,655” substitute “£3,651”, and
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£1,328” substitute “£1,825”.

(3)  In paragraph 5 (wholesale dealer’s licence: general)—
(a) in sub-paragraphs (a) and (b), for “£1,936” substitute “£2,662”, and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£968” substitute “£1,331”.

(4)  In paragraph 6(2) (wholesale dealer’s licence: traditional herbal medicinal products)—
(a) in paragraph (a), for “£744” substitute “£1,023”, and
(b) in paragraphs (b) and (c), for “£1,367” substitute “£1,880”.

(5)  In paragraph 7(3) (wholesale dealer’s licences: inspection of short duration), for “£968”,
substitute “£1,331”.

(6)  In paragraph 8 (broker’s registrations)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (1)—

(i) in paragraphs (a) and (b), for “£1,936” substitute “£2,662”,
(ii) in paragraph (b), for “£968” substitute “£1,331”, and

(b) in sub-paragraph (3), for “£582” substitute “£640”.
(7)  In paragraph 9 (active substance registrations)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (1)(a)—
(i) in sub-paragraphs (i) and (ii), for “£2,655” substitute “£3,651”,

(ii) in sub-paragraph (ii), for “£1,328” substitute “£1,825”,
(b) in sub-paragraph (1)(b)—

(i) in sub-paragraphs (i) and (ii), for “£1,936” substitute “£2,662”,
(ii) in sub- paragraph (ii), for “£968” substitute “£1,331”, and

(c) in sub-paragraph (3)—
(i) in paragraph (a), for “£792” substitute “£871”,

(ii) in paragraph (b), for “£582” substitute “£640”.
(8)  In paragraph 10 (office-based inspections)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£1,863” substitute “£2,562”, and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£1,354” substitute “£1,862”.


