
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 314

The Medicines (Products for Human Use)
(Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2023

Amendment of regulation 19A

13. In regulation 19A(1) (fees for certification of plasma master files)—
(a) in paragraph (1), for “£8,309” substitute “£9,140”,
(b) in paragraph (2)(a), for “£277” substitute “£344”, and
(c) in paragraph (2)(b), for “£734” substitute “£1,308”.

(1) Inserted by S.I. 2019/775 (as amended by S.I. 2020/1488).

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/775
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1488

