
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 300

The National Health Service (Charges for Drugs
and Appliances) (Amendment) Regulations 2023

Amendment of regulation 17

5. In regulation 17 (pre-payment certificates: repayment)—
(a) in paragraph (4)—

(i) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£30.25” substitute “£31.25”, and
(ii) in sub-paragraphs (b) and (c)(i) and (ii), for “£108.10”, at each place that it occurs,

substitute “£111.60”; and
(b) in paragraph (5), for “£30.25” substitute “£31.25”.


