
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No. 929

The Insolvency Proceedings (Fees) (Amendment) Order 2022

Amendments to the Insolvency Proceedings (Fees) Order 2016

2. The Insolvency Proceedings (Fees) Order 2016(1) is amended as follows—
(a) in article 2(b) (deposit on the presentation of a bankruptcy petition) for “£990” substitute

“£1,500”,
(b) in article 2(c) (deposit on the presentation of a winding up petition, other than a petition

presented under section 124A of the Insolvency Act 1986) for “£1,600” substitute
“£2,600”, and

(c) in article 4(1) to (9) (deposit) for “will”, in each place where it occurs, substitute “must”.

(1) S.I. 2016/692.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/692

