
S T A T U T O R Y  I N S T R U M E N T S  

2022 No. 296 

IMMIGRATION 

NATIONALITY 

The Immigration and Nationality and Immigration Services 

Commissioner (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2022 

Made - - - - at 9.30 a.m. on 15th March 2022 

Laid before Parliament at 3.00 p.m. on 15th March 2022 

Coming into force in accordance with regulation 1(2) to (9) 

The Secretary of State makes these Regulations in exercise of the powers conferred by section 

166(3)(b) of, and paragraph 5(1)(a) of Schedule 6 to, the Immigration and Asylum Act 1999(a) 

and sections 68(1), (7), (8), (10)(a) and (b), 69(2) and 74(8)(a), (b) and (c) of the Immigration Act 

2014(b). 

So far as these Regulations are made in exercise of powers conferred by the Immigration Act 

2014, they are made further to provision in the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Order 2016(c) 

and with the consent of the Treasury(d). 

Citation, commencement and extent 

1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Immigration and Nationality and Immigration 

Services Commissioner (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2022. 

(2) Except as provided by paragraphs (3) to (9), these Regulations come into force on 6th April 

2022. 

(3) The following provisions of these Regulations come into force at 9.00 a.m. on 6th April 

2022— 

(a) regulation 3(b) and Schedule 1, except so far as paragraph (6) provides for it to come into 

force at 9.00 a.m. on 10th May 2022; 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) 1999 c. 33; existing text in sub-paragraph (1) of paragraph 5 of Schedule 6 to the Immigration and Asylum Act 1999 

became paragraph (a) of that sub-paragraph by virtue of amendments made by paragraph 3(2) of Schedule 7 to the 
Immigration Act 2014 (c. 22). 

(b) 2014 c. 22. Sections 68 to 70 of the Immigration Act 2014 were extended, with modifications, to the Isle of Man by articles 
5 to 7 of the Immigration (Isle of Man) (Amendment) Order 2015 (S.I. 2015/1765) which inserted new article 22 and new 
Schedule 9A in the Immigration (Isle of Man) Order 2008 (S.I. 2008/680). Article 22 of S.I. 2008/680 was amended by the 
Immigration (Isle of Man) (Amendment) Order 2019 (S.I. 2019/562) and further amended by the Immigration (Isle of Man) 
(Amendment) Order 2020 (S.I. 2020/1214). There are other amendments to S.I. 2008/680 not relevant to this Order. 
Sections 68 to 70 were extended to the Bailiwick of Guernsey by article 4 of the Immigration (Guernsey) Order 2016 (S.I. 
2016/996) subject to modifications specified in the Schedule to that Order. Sections 68 to 70 were also extended to the 
Bailiwick of Jersey by article 3 of the Immigration (Jersey) Order 2016 (S.I. 2016/994), subject to modifications specified 
in the Schedule to that Order. 

(c) S.I. 2016/177, amended by S.I. 2017/440, 2018/329, 2019/745, 2020/1309, 2021/768, 2022/233. 
(d) Treasury consent has been obtained pursuant to section 69(1) of the Immigration Act 2014. 



 2

(b) regulation 7(3) to (5); 

(c) regulation 12 and Schedule 2. 

(4) The following provisions of these Regulations come into force at 9.00 a.m. on 11th April 

2022— 

(a) regulation 5(3)(a), (b) and (c); 

(b) regulation 5(3)(d) so far as it inserts 1.3.6I in Table 1 in Schedule 1 to the Immigration 

and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018(a); 

(c) regulation 6(3)(a), (b) and (c); 

(d) regulation 6(3)(d) so far as it inserts 6.2.6J in Table 6 in Schedule 2 to the Immigration 

and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018; 

(e) regulation 8, except so far as paragraph (9) provides for it to come into force on 22nd 

August 2022; 

(f) regulation 11. 

(5) Regulation 2 comes into force on 24th May 2022. 

(6) Paragraphs 4, 5(3) and 6(3) of Schedule 1 come into force at 9.00 a.m. on 10th May 2022. 

(7) Regulation 5(3)(d) comes into force at 9.00 a.m. on 30th May 2022 so far as it inserts 1.3.6K 

in Table 1 in Schedule 1 to the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018. 

(8) The following provisions of these Regulations come into force on 20th June 2022— 

(a) regulation 6(2) and (4)(a); 

(b) regulation 6(4)(c) so far as it inserts 9.21 and 9.22 in Table 9 in Schedule 2 to the 

Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018. 

(9) The following provisions of these Regulations come into force on 22nd August 2022— 

(a) regulation 5(3)(d) so far as it inserts 1.3.6J in Table 1 in Schedule 1 to the Immigration 

and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018; 

(b) regulation 6(3)(d) so far as it inserts 6.2.6K in Table 6 in Schedule 2 to those Regulations; 

(c) regulation 8(2)(b) and (d) and (3)(b). 

(10) These Regulations extend to England and Wales, Scotland and Northern Ireland. 

(11) The following provisions of these Regulations also extend to the Isle of Man, for the same 

purpose as the provisions of the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 which they 

amend(b)— 

(a) this regulation and regulations 3 and 10; 

(b) paragraphs 1 and 5 of Schedule 1. 

(12) The following provisions also extend to the Bailiwick of Guernsey and the Bailiwick of 

Jersey, for the same purpose as the provisions of the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) 

Regulations 2018 which they amend(c)— 

(a) this regulation and regulation 3(b); 

(b) paragraphs 1 and 6 of Schedule 1. 

Amendments to the Immigration Services Commissioner (Application Fee) Order 2011 

2.—(1) The Immigration Services Commissioner (Application Fee) Order 2011(d) is amended 

as follows. 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) S.I. 2018/330, amended by S.I. 2018/618, 2018/875, 2018/999, 2019/475, 2020/77, 2020/294, 2020/736, 2020/942, 

2020/966, 2020/1147, 2020/1309, 2021/269, 2021/768, 2021/1035. 
(b) See regulation 1(4) of the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 for the purpose for which provisions of that 

instrument extend to the Isle of Man. 
(c) See regulation 1(5) of the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 for the purpose for which provisions of that 

instrument extend to the Bailiwicks of Guernsey and Jersey. 
(d) S.I. 2011/1366, amended by S.I. 2014/2847. 



 3

(2) In article 2— 

(a) in the definition of “level 1 adviser”, in paragraph (a) for “paragraphs (ba), (d), (e), (f) 

and (g)” substitute “paragraphs (ba) and (d)”; 

(b) in the definition of “registration” omit “or (b) or (ba)”. 

(3) In article 3 for “section 84(2)(c)”, in each place it occurs, substitute “section 84(2)(b)”. 

(4) In articles 4(a) and 5(a) for “£575” substitute “£733”. 

(5) In the Schedule, in the Table of Fees— 

(a) in the row beginning “1-4”— 

(i) in Column 2 for “£1,750” substitute “£2,232”; 

(ii) in Column 3 for “£1,290” substitute “£1,646”; 

(b) in the row beginning “5-9”— 

(i) in Column 2 for “£1,960” substitute “£2,500”; 

(ii) in Column 3 for “£1,600” substitute “£2,041”; 

(c) in the row beginning “10 and over”— 

(i) in Column 2 for “£2,370” substitute “£3,023”; 

(ii) in Column 3 for “£2,115” substitute “£2,698”. 

Amendments to the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 

3. The Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 are amended as provided by— 

(a) regulations 4 to 10, and 

(b) Schedule 1 (which makes amendments increasing the amounts of certain fees specified by 

those Regulations and the amounts by which certain specified fees are to be reduced in 

specified circumstances). 

4. In regulation 10— 

(a) in paragraph (a) for sub-paragraph (ii) substitute— 

 “(ii) specified applications for certain documents and specified applications for the 

review of certain applications, for the purposes of article 6 of the 2016 Order;

”; 

(b) for paragraph (c) substitute— 

“(c) circumstances in which specified fees referred to in paragraph (a) may be waived.” 

5.—(1) Schedule 1 (applications for entry clearance to enter, and leave to enter, the United 

Kingdom) is amended as follows. 

(2) In paragraph 2(3) after “an application for” insert “entry clearance and”. 

(3) In Table 1 (fees for applications for entry clearance to enter or leave to enter the United 

Kingdom)— 

(a) in 1.3.6A in the second column for paragraph (b) substitute— 

 

 “(b) under Appendix Global Business Mobility – Senior or 

Specialist Worker to those rules(a), other than as a dependent 

partner or dependent child of a Senior or Specialist Worker, or”; 

 

 

(b) in 1.3.6B in the second column for paragraph (b) substitute— 

 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) Appendix Global Business Mobility – Senior or Specialist Worker was added to the United Kingdom immigration rules by 

the Statement of Changes in Immigration Rules laid before Parliament on 15th March 2022 (HC 1118). 



 4

 “(b) under Appendix Global Business Mobility – Senior or 

Specialist Worker to those rules, other than as a dependent 

partner or dependent child of a Senior or Specialist Worker, or”; 

 

 

(c) omit 1.3.6E; 

(d) after 1.3.6H insert— 

 

“1.3.6I Application for entry clearance— 

(a) under Appendix Global Business Mobility – Graduate 

Trainee to the immigration rules, other than as a dependent 

partner or dependent child of a Graduate Trainee, 

(b) under Appendix Global Business Mobility – UK Expansion 

Worker to those rules, other than as a dependent partner or 

dependent child of a UK Expansion Worker, 

(c) under Appendix Global Business Mobility – Service 

Supplier to those rules, other than as a dependent partner or 

dependent child of a Service Supplier, or 

(d) under Appendix Global Business Mobility – Secondment 

Worker to those rules, other than as a dependent partner or 

dependent child of a Secondment Worker(a). 

£259 

1.3.6J Application for entry clearance under Appendix Scale-up to the 

immigration rules(b), other than as a dependent partner or 

dependent child on the Scale-up route under that Appendix. 

£715 

1.3.6K Application for entry clearance under Appendix High Potential 

Individual to the immigration rules(c), other than as a dependent 

partner or dependent child of a High Potential Individual. 

£715” 

 

(e) after 1.3C.2 insert— 

 

“1.3D Fee for applications for entry clearance and indefinite leave to enter the 

United Kingdom as a foreign or Commonwealth citizen discharged from 

HM Forces 

1.3D.1 Application for entry clearance and indefinite leave to enter 

under paragraph 13 of Appendix Armed Forces to the 

immigration rules. 

£2,404” 

 

(4) In Table 3 (fee for applications for indefinite leave to enter the United Kingdom – 

dependants of members of HM Forces)— 

(a) in the heading of the table, after “applications for” insert “entry clearance and”; 

(b) in 3.1 in the second column, after “applications for” insert “entry clearance and”; 

(c) in 3.1.1 in the second column, after “Application for” insert “entry clearance and”. 

(5) In Table 4 (exceptions in respect of fees for applications for entry clearance to enter or leave 

to enter the United Kingdom)— 

(a) omit 4.9 and 4.9.1; 

(b) at the end insert— 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) Appendix Global Business Mobility – Graduate Trainee, Appendix Global Business Mobility – UK Expansion Worker, 

Appendix Global Business Mobility – Service Supplier and Appendix Global Business Mobility – Secondment Worker 
were added to the United Kingdom immigration rules by the Statement of Changes in Immigration Rules laid before 
Parliament on 15th March 2022 (HC 1118). 

(b) Appendix Scale-up was added to the United Kingdom immigration rules by the Statement of Changes in Immigration Rules 
laid before Parliament on 15th March 2022 (HC 1118). 

(c) Appendix High Potential Individual was added to the United Kingdom immigration rules by the Statement of Changes in 
Immigration Rules laid before Parliament on 15th March 2022 (HC 1118). 



 5

 

“4.11 Applications for entry clearance and indefinite leave to enter by certain 

foreign or Commonwealth citizens discharged from HM Forces 

4.11.1 No fee is payable in respect of an application for entry clearance 

and indefinite leave to enter the United Kingdom made under 

paragraph 13 of Appendix Armed Forces to the immigration 

rules if— 

(a) in a case where the application is made on the basis of the 

completion of a period of reckonable service in HM Forces, the 

applicant’s period of reckonable service is at least 6 years, or 

(b) in a case where the application is made on the basis of 

meeting the medical discharge criteria, the cause was 

attributable to service in HM Forces 

(with expressions used in (a) and (b) being construed in 

accordance with that Appendix). 

1.3D.1” 

 

6.—(1) Schedule 2 (applications for leave to remain in the United Kingdom) is amended as 

follows. 

(2) In paragraph 1(1) in the definition of “specified human rights application”— 

(a) for paragraph (a) substitute— 

“(a) Appendix Private Life to the immigration rules(a);”; 

(b) in paragraph (b) after “section R-LTRP.1.1. (a), (b)” insert “, (c)”; 

(c) in paragraph (c) after “section R-LTRPT.1.1. (a), (b)” insert “, (c)”. 

(3) In Table 6 (fees for applications for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom and 

connected applications)— 

(a) in 6.2.6A in the second column for paragraph (b) substitute— 

 

 “(b) under Appendix Global Business Mobility – Senior or 

Specialist Worker to those rules, other than as a dependent 

partner or dependent child of a Senior or Specialist Worker, or”; 

 

 

(b) in 6.2.6B in the second column for paragraph (b) substitute— 

 

 “(b) under Appendix Global Business Mobility – Senior or 

Specialist Worker to those rules, other than as a dependent 

partner or dependent child of a Senior or Specialist Worker,”; 

 

 

(c) omit 6.2.6E; 

(d) after 6.2.6I insert— 

 

“6.2.6J Application for limited leave to remain in the United 

Kingdom— 

(a) under Appendix Global Business Mobility – Graduate 

Trainee to the immigration rules, other than as a dependent 

partner or dependent child of a Graduate Trainee, 

(b) under Appendix Global Business Mobility – UK Expansion 

Worker to those rules, other than as a dependent partner or 

dependent child of a UK Expansion Worker, 

£259 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) Appendix Private Life was added to the United Kingdom immigration rules by the Statement of Changes in Immigration 

Rules laid before Parliament on 15th March 2022 (HC 1118). 



 6

(c) under Appendix Global Business Mobility – Service 

Supplier to those rules, other than as a dependent partner or 

dependent child of a Service Supplier, or 

(d) under Appendix Global Business Mobility – Secondment 

Worker to those rules, other than as a dependent partner or 

dependent child of a Secondment Worker. 

6.2.6K Application for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom 

made under Appendix Scale-up to the immigration rules, other 

than as a dependent partner or dependent child on the Scale-up 

route under that Appendix. 

£715” 

 

(4) In Table 9 (exceptions and waivers in respect of fees for applications for, or in connection 

with, leave to remain in the United Kingdom)— 

(a) in 9.9 in the second column— 

(i) in paragraph (a)— 

(aa) in sub-paragraph (i) omit “it is”; 

(bb) omit the “or” after sub-paragraph (vi); 

(cc) after sub-paragraph (vii) insert— 

 

 “or 

(viii) Appendix Private Life to the immigration rules;” 

 

 

(ii) in paragraph (b)— 

(aa) omit sub-paragraph (ii); 

(bb) at the end insert— 

 

 “(iii) on the basis of the right to private and family life under 

Article 8 of the European Convention on Human Rights(a).” 

 

 

(b) in 9.12.1 and 9.12.2 in the third column for “Fee 6.1.1” substitute “Fees 6.1.1, 8.1.1”; 

(c) at the end insert— 

 

“9.18 Applications for indefinite leave to remain in the United Kingdom by 

certain foreign or Commonwealth citizens discharged from HM Forces 

 No fee is payable in respect of an application for indefinite leave 

to remain in the United Kingdom made under paragraph 16 of 

Appendix Armed Forces to the immigration rules if— 

(a) in a case where the application is made on the basis of the 

completion of a period of reckonable service in HM Forces, the 

applicant’s period of reckonable service is at least 6 years, or 

(b) in a case where the application is made on the basis of 

meeting the medical discharge criteria, the cause was 

attributable to service in HM Forces 

(with expressions used in (a) and (b) being construed in 

accordance with that Appendix). 

Fee 8.1.1 

9.19 Applications for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom under 

Appendix Innovator to the immigration rules resulting from variation by 

the Secretary of State of an application for indefinite leave to remain 

 No fee is payable in respect of an application for limited leave to Fee 6.2A.1 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) European Treaty Series No. 005. 



 7

remain in the United Kingdom under Appendix Innovator to the 

immigration rules arising by virtue of the variation by the 

Secretary of State, under paragraph INN 22.1A or INN 42.1A of 

that Appendix(a), of an application for indefinite leave to 

remain in the United Kingdom. 

9.20 Applications for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom under 

Appendix Hong Kong British National (Overseas) to the immigration rules 

resulting from variation by the Secretary of State of an application for 

indefinite leave to remain 

 No fee is payable in respect of an application for limited leave to 

remain in the United Kingdom under Appendix Hong Kong 

British National (Overseas) to the immigration rules arising by 

virtue of the variation by the Secretary of State, under paragraph 

HK 64.1A of that Appendix(b), of an application for indefinite 

leave to remain in the United Kingdom. 

Fees 6.2C.1, 

6.2C.2 

9.21 Applications for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom under 

Appendix Private Life to the immigration rules resulting from variation by 

the Secretary of State of an application for indefinite leave to remain 

 No fee is payable in respect of an application for limited leave to 

remain in the United Kingdom under Appendix Private Life to 

the immigration rules(c) arising by virtue of the variation by the 

Secretary of State, under paragraph PL 18.2 or PL 33.2 of that 

Appendix, of an application for indefinite leave to remain in the 

United Kingdom. 

Fee 6.1.1 

9.22 Applications for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom under 

Appendix FM to the immigration rules resulting from variation by the 

Secretary of State of an application for indefinite leave to remain under 

Appendix Settlement Family Life to those rules 

 No fee is payable in respect of an application for limited leave to 

remain in the United Kingdom under Appendix FM to the 

immigration rules arising by virtue of the variation by the 

Secretary of State, under paragraph SETF 9.2 or SETF 17.2 of 

Appendix Settlement Family Life to those rules(d), of an 

application for indefinite leave to remain in the United Kingdom 

under Appendix Settlement Family Life to those rules. 

Fee 6.1.1 

9.23 Applications for indefinite or limited leave to remain in the United 

Kingdom: waiver of fee as a remedy for maladministration 

 The Secretary of State may waive the payment of any fee 

specified in Table 6, 7 or 8 in respect of an application for 

limited or indefinite leave to remain in the United Kingdom 

where the Secretary of State considers that— 

(a) the person in respect of whom the application is made has 

suffered any detriment in connection with immigration or 

nationality as a result of maladministration by the Home Office, 

and 

(b) the appropriate remedy (or part of the appropriate remedy) 

for that maladministration is to waive the payment of the fee in 

respect of the application. 

All Fees in 

Tables 6, 7 

and 8” 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) Appendix Innovator was amended by the Statement of Changes in Immigration Rules laid before Parliament on 15th March 

2022 (HC 1118). 
(b) Appendix Hong Kong British National (Overseas) was amended by the Statement of Changes in Immigration Rules laid 

before Parliament on 15th March 2022 (HC 1118). 
(c) Appendix Private Life was added to the United Kingdom immigration rules by the Statement of Changes in Immigration 

Rules laid before Parliament on 15th March 2022 (HC 1118). 
(d) Appendix Settlement Family Life was added to the United Kingdom immigration rules by the Statement of Changes in 

Immigration Rules laid before Parliament on 15th March 2022 (HC 1118). 



 8

 

(5) In paragraph 3 after “Table 9” insert “(other than the exception in 9.18 of that Table)”. 

7.—(1) Schedule 3 (documents and administration) is amended as follows. 

(2) In paragraph 2 at the end (before Table 10) insert— 

“(6) Paragraph 4 confers a discretion on the Secretary of State to waive, in specified 

circumstances, any fee specified in Table 10 or 12.” 

(3) In Table 10 (fees for miscellaneous documents and services) omit 10.1.2, 10.6.2 and 10.6.4. 

(4) In Table 12 (fees for applications for biometric immigration documents, the process used to 

take a record of biometric information and the reuse of biometric information)— 

(a) omit 12.2.2; 

(b) in 12.2.4 for the words in the second column substitute— 

 

 “The process used to take a record of a person’s biometric 

information for the purposes of, or the reuse of a person’s 

biometric information in connection with— 

(a) an application referred to in fee 10.1.1, 10.5A.1, 10.5A.2, 

10.6.3 or 10.6.5, or 

(b) an application referred to in fee 10.6.1, other than an 

application for a biometric immigration document made in 

accordance with regulation 3 of the 2008 Regulations by a 

person falling within paragraph (3) of that regulation.” 

 

 

(5) In Table 13 (exceptions to the requirement to pay fees for applications for biometric 

immigration documents, the process used to take a record of biometric information and the reuse 

of biometric information)— 

(a) in 13.4.1 and 13.5.1 for the words in the third column substitute “Fee 12.2.1” 

(b) omit 13.6, 13.6.1, 13.7 and 13.7.1; 

(c) in 13.Z7A.1 in the third column omit “, 12.2.2”; 

(d) in 13.7A.1 for the words in the third column substitute “Fee 10.6.1”; 

(e) in 13.8.1 in the second column for “in any of 10.6.1 to 10.6.5” substitute “in 10.6.1, 

10.6.3 or 10.6.5, or made an application at any time before 9.00 a.m. on 6th April 2022 

for which a fee was specified in 10.6.2 or 10.6.4 when the application was made”. 

(6) At the end insert— 

“Waiver of fee as a remedy for maladministration 

4. The Secretary of State may waive the payment of any fee specified in Table 10 or 12 in 

respect of any application, request or process where the Secretary of State considers that— 

(a) the person in respect of whom the application or request is made or (as the case 

may be) in relation to whom the process is to be carried out has suffered any 

detriment in connection with immigration or nationality as a result of 

maladministration by the Home Office, and 

(b) the appropriate remedy (or part of the appropriate remedy) for that 

maladministration is to waive the payment of the fee in respect of the application, 

request or process.” 

8.—(1) Schedule 4 (sponsorship) is amended as follows. 

(2) In paragraph 1— 

(a) in the definition of “temporary workers”— 

(i) omit the “or” after paragraph (f); 



 9

(ii) after paragraph (g) insert— 

“(h) Appendix Global Business Mobility - Graduate Trainee to those rules, 

(i) Appendix Global Business Mobility – UK Expansion Worker to those rules, 

(j) Appendix Global Business Mobility – Service Supplier to those rules, or 

(k) Appendix Global Business Mobility – Secondment Worker to those rules;”; 

(b) in the definition of “temporary workers” as amended by sub-paragraph (a)— 

(i) omit the “or” after paragraph (j); 

(ii) after paragraph (k) insert— 

“or 

(l) Appendix Scale-up to those rules;”; 

(c) in the definition of “the temporary worker route”, after paragraph (g) insert— 

“(h) the Global Business Mobility – Graduate Trainee route provided for by Appendix 

Global Business Mobility – Graduate Trainee to those rules; 

(i) the Global Business Mobility – UK Expansion Worker route provided for by 

Appendix Global Business Mobility – UK Expansion Worker to those rules; 

(j) the Global Business Mobility – Service Supplier route provided for by Appendix 

Global Business Mobility – Service Supplier to those rules; 

(k) the Global Business Mobility – Secondment Worker route provided for by 

Appendix Global Business Mobility – Secondment Worker to those rules;”; 

(d) in the definition of “the temporary worker route” as amended by sub-paragraph (c), after 

paragraph (k) insert— 

“(l) the Scale-up route provided for by Appendix Scale-up to those rules;”; 

(e) in the definition of “workers”— 

(i) omit paragraph (b); 

(ii) omit the “or” after paragraph (c); 

(iii) after paragraph (d) insert— 

“or 

(e) Appendix Global Business Mobility – Senior or Specialist Worker to those rules;”; 

(f) in the definition of “the worker route”— 

(i) omit paragraphs (b) and (c); 

(ii) after paragraph (e) insert— 

“(f) the Global Business Mobility – Senior or Specialist Worker route provided for by 

Appendix Global Business Mobility – Senior or Specialist Worker to those rules;”. 

(3) In Table 14 (fees in relation to sponsor licences, premium services for sponsors, certificates 

of sponsorship and confirmations of acceptance for studies)— 

(a) in 14.4.1 in the second column for “Appendix Intra-Company routes or Appendix T2 

Minister of Religion” substitute “Appendix T2 Minister of Religion or Appendix Global 

Business Mobility – Senior or Specialist Worker”; 

(b) in 14.4.3 in the second column, at the end insert— 

 

 “(g) Appendix Scale-up.”;  

 

(c) at the end insert— 

 

“14.4.4 The issuing of a certificate of sponsorship in respect of an 

application or potential application under any of the following 

Appendices to the immigration rules— 

£21” 



 10

(a) Appendix Global Business Mobility – Graduate Trainee; 

(b) Appendix Global Business Mobility – UK Expansion 

Worker; 

(c) Appendix Global Business Mobility – Service Supplier; 

(d) Appendix Global Business Mobility – Secondment Worker. 

 

(4) In paragraph 3(2ZA)(b) for “Appendix Intra-Company Routes or Appendix T2 Minister of 

Religion” substitute “Appendix T2 Minister of Religion or Appendix Global Business Mobility – 

Senior or Specialist Worker”. 

9.—(1) Schedule 8 (nationality) is amended as follows. 

(2) In paragraph 2— 

(a) in sub-paragraph (1A) for “Tables 19 and 20” substitute “Table 19”; 

(b) at the end (before Table 19) insert— 

“(4) Paragraph 7 confers a discretion on the Secretary of State to waive, in specified 

circumstances, any fee specified in Table 19 or 20.” 

(3) In Table 20 (fees for applications, processes and services in connection with nationality) 

omit 20.2.2. 

(4) In Table 20A (exceptions in respect of fees for applications for registration as a British 

citizen under the 1981 Act and for the reuse of biometric information)— 

(a) in the heading of the table— 

(i) for “Exceptions” substitute “Exception”; 

(ii) omit “and for the reuse of biometric information”; 

(b) omit 20A.2 and 20A.2.1. 

(5) At the end insert— 

“Waiver of fee as a remedy for maladministration 

7. The Secretary of State may waive the payment of any fee specified in Table 19 or 20 in 

respect of any application, process or service where the Secretary of State considers that— 

(a) the person in respect of whom the application is made or (as the case may be) in 

relation to whom the process or service is to be carried out or provided has 

suffered any detriment in connection with immigration or nationality as a result of 

maladministration by the Home Office, and 

(b) the appropriate remedy (or part of the appropriate remedy) for that 

maladministration is to waive the payment of the fee in respect of the application, 

process or service.” 

10.—(1) Schedule 9 (applications in relation to entry clearance to enter the Isle of Man and 

premium services) is amended as follows. 

(2) In paragraph 1 at the end insert— 

““Worker (Seasonal) Migrant” has the meaning given by paragraph 6 of the Isle of Man 

immigration rules.” 

(3) In Table 21 (fees for applications for entry clearance to enter the Isle of Man) after 21.3.8 

insert— 

 

“21.3.9 Application for entry clearance as a Worker (Seasonal) Migrant. £259” 

Saving of provisions amended by regulations 5(3) and 6(3) 

11.—(1) 1.3.6A and 1.3.6B in Table 1 in Schedule 1 to the 2018 Regulations continue to have 

effect as they had effect immediately before commencement, without the amendments made by 



 11

regulation 5(3)(a) and (b), for the purposes of the provision by paragraph 3 of that Schedule of a 

fee for an application for entry clearance to enter the United Kingdom made by a dependant of a 

person who— 

(a) has entry clearance to enter the United Kingdom, granted before commencement under 

Appendix Intra-Company Routes to the immigration rules(a) on the Intra-Company 

Transfer route under that Appendix, or 

(b) made an application before commencement for entry clearance to enter the United 

Kingdom on that route which had not been determined immediately before 

commencement. 

(2) Despite its revocation by regulation 5(3)(c), 1.3.6E in Table 1 in Schedule 1 to the 2018 

Regulations continues to have effect, as it had effect immediately before commencement but with 

the modification in paragraph (3), for the purposes of the provision by paragraph 3 of that 

Schedule of a fee for an application for entry clearance to enter the United Kingdom made by a 

dependant of a person who— 

(a) has entry clearance to enter the United Kingdom, granted before commencement under 

Appendix Intra-Company Routes to the immigration rules on the Intra-Company 

Graduate Trainee route under that Appendix, or 

(b) made an application before commencement for entry clearance to enter the United 

Kingdom on that route which had not been determined immediately before 

commencement. 

(3) 1.3.6E in Table 1 in Schedule 1 to the 2018 Regulations, as it continues to have effect for the 

purposes referred to in paragraph (2), is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column 

were £259 (rather than £482). 

(4) 6.2.6A and 6.2.6B in Table 6 in Schedule 2 to the 2018 Regulations continue to have effect 

as they had effect immediately before commencement, without the amendments made by 

regulation 6(3)(a) and (b), for the purposes of the provision by paragraph 3 of that Schedule of a 

fee for an application for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom made by a dependant of a 

person who— 

(a) has limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom, granted before commencement under 

Appendix Intra-Company Routes to the immigration rules on the Intra-Company Transfer 

route under that Appendix, or 

(b) made an application before commencement for limited leave to remain in the United 

Kingdom on that route which had not been determined immediately before 

commencement. 

(5) Despite its revocation by regulation 6(3)(c), 6.2.6E in Table 6 in Schedule 2 to the 2018 

Regulations continues to have effect, as it had effect immediately before commencement but with 

the modification made by paragraph (6), for the purposes of the provision by paragraph 3 of that 

Schedule of a fee for an application for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom made by a 

dependant of a person who— 

(a) has limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom, granted before commencement under 

Appendix Intra-Company Routes to the immigration rules on the Intra-Company 

Graduate Trainee route under that Appendix, or 

(b) made an application before commencement for limited leave to remain in the United 

Kingdom on that route which had not been determined immediately before 

commencement. 

(6) 6.2.6E in Table 6 in Schedule 2 to the 2018 Regulations, as it continues to have effect for the 

purposes referred to in paragraph (5), is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column 

were £259 (rather than £482). 

(7) In this regulation— 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) Appendix Intra-Company Routes was removed from the United Kingdom immigration rules, subject to savings, by the 

Statement of Changes in Immigration Rules laid before Parliament on 15th March 2022 (HC 1118). 



 12

“the 2018 Regulations” means the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018; 

“commencement” means 9.00 a.m. on 11th April 2022; 

“dependant” has the meaning given by regulation 2 of the 2018 Regulations; 

“the immigration rules” means the rules made under section 3(2) of the Immigration Act 

1971(a). 

Modification of saved provisions of the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 

12. Schedule 2 contains modifications to provisions of the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) 

Regulations 2018 saved by instruments amending those Regulations. 

 

 

 

 Kevin Foster 

 Parliamentary Under Secretary of State 

At 9.30 a.m. on 15th March 2022 Home Office 

 

 

We consent 

 

 Michael Tomlinson 

 Rebecca Harris 

14th March 2022 Two of the Lords Commissioners of Her Majesty’s Treasury 

 

 SCHEDULE 1 Regulation 3(b) 

Amendments to the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 

increasing the amount of specified fees and deductions from specified 

fees 

 

1. The Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 are amended as follows. 

2.—(1) Schedule 1 (applications for entry clearance to enter, and leave to enter, the United 

Kingdom) is amended as follows. 

(2) In Table 1 (fees for applications for entry clearance to enter the United Kingdom)— 

(a) in 1.1.1 in the third column for “£95” substitute “£100”; 

(b) in 1.1.2 in the third column for “£361” substitute “£376”; 

(c) in 1.1.3 in the third column for “£655” substitute “£670”; 

(d) in 1.1.4 in the third column for “£822” substitute “£837”; 

(e) in 1.1.5 and 1.1.6 in the third column for “£190” substitute “£200”; 

(f) in 1.1.8 in the third column for “£95” substitute “£100”; 

(g) in 1.2.2 in the third column for “£186” substitute “£200”; 

(h) in 1.3.4 in the third column for “£1,021” substitute “£1,036”; 

(i) in 1.3.6 in the third column for “£1,623” substitute “£1,638”; 

(j) in 1.3.6A in the third column for “£610” substitute “£625”; 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) 1971 c. 77. The United Kingdom immigration rules were laid before Parliament on 23rd May 1994 (HC 395) and have been 

subsequently amended. 



 13

(k) in 1.3.6B in the third column for “£1,220” substitute “£1,235”; 

(l) in 1.3.6C in the third column for “£464” substitute “£479”; 

(m) in 1.3.6D in the third column for “£928” substitute “£943”; 

(n) in 1.3.6E in the third column for “£482” substitute “£497”; 

(o) in 1.3.6F and 1.3.6G in the third column for “£244” substitute “£259”; 

(p) in 1.3.6H in the third column for “£610” substitute “£625”; 

(q) in 1.3.11A in the third column for “£348” substitute “£363”; 

(r) in 1.3A.1 in the third column for £1,021” substitute “£1,036”; 

(s) in 1.3A.2 in the third column for “£363” substitute “£378”; 

(t) in 1.3B.2 in the third column for “£152” substitute “£167”; 

(u) in 1.3B.3 in the third column for “£608” substitute “£623”; 

(v) in 1.4.4 in the third column for “£1,523” substitute “£1,538”; 

(w) in 1.4.6 in the third column for “£610” substitute “£625”; 

(x) in 1.4.7 in the third column for “£1,033” substitute “£1,048”; 

(y) in 1.5.1 in the third column for “£516” substitute “£531”. 

(3) In Table 2 (specified fees for dependants)— 

(a) in 2.1.1 in the third column for “£608” substitute “£623”; 

(b) in 2.1.1A in the third column for “£363” substitute “£378”; 

(c) in 2.1.6 in the third column for “£608” substitute “£623”. 

(4) In Table 3 (fee for applications for entry clearance and indefinite leave to enter the United 

Kingdom – dependants of members of HM Forces) in 3.1.1 in the third column for “£2,389” 

substitute “£2,404”. 

(5) In paragraph 3A (reduction of fees for Health and Care Visa applications and related 

applications by dependants)— 

(a) in sub-paragraph (2) for paragraph (c) substitute— 

“(c) by £232, where it is the fee specified by 1.3.6C of that Table; 

(d) by £464, where it is the fee specified by 1.3.6D of that Table.”; 

(b) in sub-paragraph (3) for paragraph (c) substitute— 

“(c) by £232, where it is the fee specified by 1.3.6C of that Table; 

(d) by £464, where it is the fee specified by 1.3.6D of that Table.”; 

(c) in sub-paragraph (4) for paragraph (c) substitute— 

“(c) by £232, where it is the fee specified by 1.3.9 of that Table as it continues to have 

effect by virtue of that regulation (and as modified by paragraph 2(4) of Schedule 

2 to the Immigration and Nationality and Immigration Services Commissioner 

(Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2022); 

(d) by £464, where it is the fee specified by 1.3.10 of that Table as it continues to have 

effect by virtue of that regulation (and as modified by paragraph 2(5) of Schedule 

2 to Immigration and Nationality and Immigration Services Commissioner (Fees) 

(Amendment) Regulations 2022.” 

3.—(1) Schedule 2 (applications for leave to remain in the United Kingdom) is amended as 

follows. 

(2) In Table 6 (fees for applications for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom and 

connected applications)— 

(a) in 6.1.1 in the third column for “£1,033” substitute “£1,048”; 

(b) in 6.2.4 in the third column for “£1,277” substitute “£1,292”; 

(c) in 6.2.6 in the third column for “£1,623” substitute “£1,638”; 



 14

(d) in 6.2.6A in the third column for “£704” substitute “£719”; 

(e) in 6.2.6B in the third column for “£1,408” substitute “£1,423”; 

(f) in 6.2.6C in the third column for “£464” substitute “£479”; 

(g) in 6.2.6D in the third column for “£928” substitute “£943”; 

(h) in 6.2.6E in the third column for “£482” substitute “£497”; 

(i) in 6.2.6F in the third column for “£244” substitute “£259”; 

(j) in 6.2.6G in the third column for “£700” substitute “£715”; 

(k) in 6.2.6H in the third column for “£244” substitute “£259”; 

(l) in 6.2.6I in the third column for “£704” substitute “£719”; 

(m) in 6.2.11A in the third column for “£475” substitute “£490”; 

(n) in 6.2A.1 in the third column for “£1,277” substitute “£1,292”; 

(o) in 6.2A.2 in the third column for “£493” substitute “£508”; 

(p) in 6.2B.2 in the third column for “£152” substitute “£167”; 

(q) in 6.2B.3 in the third column for “£608” substitute “£623”; 

(r) in 6.3.1 in the third column for “£704” substitute “£719”; 

(s) in 6.3.2 in the third column for “£1,949” substitute “£1,964”; 

(t) in 6.3.3 in the third column for “£993” substitute “£1,000”. 

(3) In Table 7 (fees for specified applications for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom 

as a dependant)— 

(a) in 7.1.1 in the third column for “£608” substitute “£623”; 

(b) in 7.1.1A in the third column for “£493” substitute “£508”; 

(c) in 7.1.5 in the third column for “£608” substitute “£623”. 

(4) In Table 8 (fees for applications for indefinite leave to remain in the United Kingdom) in 

8.1.1 in the third column for “£2,389” substitute “£2,404”. 

(5) In paragraph 3A (reduction of fees for Health and Care Visa applications and related 

applications by dependants)— 

(a) in sub-paragraph (2) for paragraph (c) substitute— 

“(c) by £232, where it is the fee specified by 6.2.6C of that Table; 

(d) by £464, where it is the fee specified by 6.2.6D of that Table.”; 

(b) in sub-paragraph (3) for paragraph (c) substitute— 

“(c) by £232, where it is the fee specified by 6.2.6C of that Table; 

(d) by £464, where it is the fee specified by 6.2.6D of that Table.”; 

(c) in sub-paragraph (4) for paragraph (c) substitute— 

“(c) by £232, where it is the fee specified by 6.2.9 of that Table as it continues to have 

effect by virtue of that regulation (and as modified by paragraph 4(4) of Schedule 

2 to the Immigration and Nationality and Immigration Services Commissioner 

(Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2022); 

(d) by £464, where it is the fee specified by 6.2.10 of that Table as it continues to have 

effect by virtue of that regulation (and as modified by paragraph 4(5) of Schedule 

2 to the Immigration and Nationality and Immigration Services Commissioner 

(Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2022).” 

4.—(1) Schedule 7 (premium services outside the United Kingdom) is amended as follows. 

(2) In Table 18 (premium services outside the United Kingdom) in 18.2.1 in the third column for 

“£220” substitute “£250”. 



 15

5.—(1) Schedule 9 (applications in relation to entry clearance to enter the Isle of Man and 

premium services) is amended as follows. 

(2) In Table 21 (fees for applications for entry clearance to enter the Isle of Man)— 

(a) in 21.1.1 in the third column for “£95” substitute “£100”; 

(b) in 21.1.2 in the third column for “£361” substitute “£376”; 

(c) in 21.1.3 in the third column for “£655” substitute “£670”; 

(d) in 21.1.4 in the third column for “£822” substitute “£837”; 

(e) in 21.1.5 and 21.1.6 in the third column for “£190” substitute “£200”; 

(f) in 21.2.1 in the third column for “£152” substitute “£167”; 

(g) in 21.2.2 in the third column for “£608” substitute “£623”; 

(h) in 21.2.5 in the third column for “£1,623” substitute “£1,638”; 

(i) in 21.2.6 in the third column for “£348” substitute “£363”; 

(j) in 21.2.7 in the third column for “£244” substitute “£259”; 

(k) in 21.3.2 in the third column for “£1,523” substitute “£1,538”; 

(l) in 21.3.4, 21.3.5 and 21.3.6 in the third column for “£610” substitute “£625”; 

(m) in 21.3.7 in the third column for “£1,021” substitute “£1,036”; 

(n) in 21.3.8 in the third column for “£363” substitute “£378”; 

(o) in 21.4.1 in the third column for “£516” substitute “£531”; 

(p) in 22.1.1 in the third column for “£608” substitute “£623”; 

(q) in 22.1.1A in the third column for “£1,021” substitute “£1,036”; 

(r) in 22.1.1B in the third column for “£363” substitute “£378”; 

(s) in 22.1.2 in the third column for “£604” substitute “£619”; 

(t) in 22.1.3 in the third column for “£1,021” substitute “£1,036”. 

(3) In Table 25 (premium services outside the United Kingdom and the Isle of Man) in 25.2.1 in 

the third column for “£220” substitute “£250”. 

6.—(1) Schedule 10 (applications for entry clearance to enter the Bailiwick of Guernsey or the 

Bailiwick of Jersey and premium services) is amended as follows. 

(2) In Table 26 (fees for applications for entry clearance to enter the Bailiwick of Guernsey or 

the Bailiwick of Jersey)— 

(a) in 26.1.1 in the third column for “£516” substitute “£531”; 

(b) in 26.2.1 in the third column for “£95” substitute “£100”; 

(c) in 26.2.2 in the third column for “£361” substitute “£376”; 

(d) in 26.2.3 in the third column for “£655” substitute “£670”; 

(e) in 26.2.4 in the third column for “£822” substitute “£837”; 

(f) in 26.3.1 in the third column for “£348” substitute “£363”; 

(g) in 26.4.1 in the third column for “£610” substitute “£625”; 

(h) in 26.4.1ZA in the third column for “£244” substitute “£259”; 

(i) in 26.4.1A in the third column for “£244” substitute “£259”; 

(j) in 26.4.2 in the third column for “£1,523” substitute “£1,538”. 

(3) In Table 27 (premium services outside the United Kingdom and the relevant bailiwick) in 

27.2.1 in the third column for “£220” substitute “£250”. 



 16

 SCHEDULE 2 Regulation 12 

Modifications to saved provisions of the Immigration and Nationality 

(Fees) Regulations 2018 

Applications for entry clearance by dependants of a main applicant: changes to fees 

1.—(1) This paragraph applies to 1.3.6A in Table 1 in Schedule 1 to the Immigration and 

Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 as it continues to have effect by virtue of regulation 5(1) of 

the Immigration and Nationality (Replacement of T2 Sportsperson Route and Fees) (Amendment) 

Regulations 2021(a) for the purposes mentioned in that regulation. 

(2) 1.3.6A in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £244 

(rather than £610) in respect of an application under Appendix T2 Sportsperson where a certificate 

of sponsorship has been issued for a period of 12 months or less. 

2.—(1) This paragraph applies to 1.3.7, 1.3.8, 1.3.9, 1.3.10, 1.3.11, 1.3.13, 1.3A.1, 1.3A.2 and 

14.6 in Table 1 in Schedule 1 to the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 as they 

continue to have effect by virtue of regulation 14(1), (3), (4) and (5) of the Immigration and 

Nationality (Replacement of Tier 2 and Fees) (Amendment) (EU Exit) Regulations 2020(b) for the 

purposes mentioned in that regulation. 

(2) 1.3.7 in that Table is to be read— 

(a) as though the fee specified in the third column were £625 (rather than £610), except in 

respect of an application for entry clearance as a Tier 2 (Sportsperson) Migrant where a 

certificate of sponsorship has been issued for a period of 12 months or less, and 

(b) as though the fee specified in the third column were £259 (rather than £610) in respect of 

an application for entry clearance as a Tier 2 (Sportsperson) Migrant where a certificate 

of sponsorship has been issued for a period of 12 months or less. 

(3) 1.3.8 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £1,235 

(rather than £1,220). 

(4) 1.3.9 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £479 

(rather than £464). 

(5) 1.3.10 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £943 

(rather than £928). 

(6) 1.3.11 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £497 

(rather than £482). 

(7) 1.3.13 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £259 

(rather than £244). 

(8) 1.3A.1 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £1,036 

(rather than £1,021). 

(9) 1.3A.2 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £378 

(rather than £363). 

(10) 1.4.6 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £625 

(rather than £610). 

3.—(1) This paragraph applies to 1.3.12 in Table 1 in Schedule 1 to the Immigration and 

Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 as it continues to have effect by virtue of regulation 24(1) of 

the Immigration and Nationality (Replacement of Tier 4 and Fees) and Passport (Fees) 

(Amendment) Regulations 2020(c) for the purposes mentioned in that regulation. 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) S.I. 2021/1035. 
(b) S.I. 2020/1147. 
(c) S.I. 2020/966. 



 17

(2) 1.3.12 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £363 

(rather than £348). 

Applications for limited leave to remain by dependants of a main applicant: changes to fees 

4.—(1) This paragraph applies to 6.2.7, 6.2.8, 6.2.9, 6.2.10, 6.2.11, 6.2.13, 6.2A.1, 6.2A.2 and 

6.3.1 in Table 6 in Schedule 2 to the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 as they 

continue to have effect by virtue of regulation 14(6), (7), (8) and (9) of the Immigration and 

Nationality (Replacement of Tier 2 and Fees) (Amendment) (EU Exit) Regulations 2020 for the 

purposes mentioned in that regulation. 

(2) 6.2.7 in that Table is to be read— 

(a) as though the fee specified in the third column were £719 (rather than £704), except in 

respect of an application for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom as a Tier 2 

(Sportsperson) Migrant where a certificate of sponsorship has been issued for a period of 

12 months or less, and 

(b) as though the fee specified in the third column were £259 (rather than £704) in respect of 

an application for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom as a Tier 2 

(Sportsperson) Migrant where a certificate of sponsorship has been issued for a period of 

12 months or less. 

(3) 6.2.8 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £1,423 

(rather than £1,408). 

(4) 6.2.9 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £479 

(rather than £464). 

(5) 6.2.10 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £943 

(rather than £928). 

(6) 6.2.11 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £497 

(rather than £482). 

(7) 6.2.13 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £259 

(rather than £244). 

(8) 6.2A.1 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £1,292 

(rather than £1,277). 

(9) 6.2A.2 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £508 

(rather than £493). 

(10) 6.3.1 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £719 

(rather than £704). 

5.—(1) This paragraph applies to 6.2.12 in Table 6 in Schedule 2 to the Immigration and 

Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 as it continues to have effect by virtue of regulation 24(2) of 

the Immigration and Nationality (Replacement of Tier 4 and Fees) and Passport (Fees) 

(Amendment) Regulations 2020 for the purposes mentioned in that regulation. 

(2) 6.2.12 in that Table is to be read as though the fee specified in the third column were £490 

(rather than £475). 

 

 

 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Regulations) 

These Regulations amend the Immigration Services Commissioner (Application Fee) Order 2011 

(“the 2011 Order”) and the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Regulations 2018 (“the 2018 

Regulations”). 

Regulation 2 amends the 2011 Order, which sets the fees to be paid on making an application for 

registration or continued registration with the Immigration Services Commissioner under section 



 18

85 of the Immigration and Asylum Act 1999. The amendments increase specified fees and make 

changes to definitions for the purposes of the fees specified in the Schedule to the 2011 Order. 

Regulation 2(2)(b) corrects an error in the definition of “registration” in the 2011 Order. 

The remaining provisions of these Regulations amend the 2018 Regulations, which are concerned 

with the fees payable for the exercise of various functions in connection with immigration and 

nationality. 

The amendments made by regulation 3(b) and Schedule 1 to these Regulations increase the 

amount of various fees specified by the 2018 Regulations, and also increase specified amounts 

required to be deducted from the fees payable for certain Health and Care Visa applications. 

Regulations 4(a), 7(3) to (5) and 9(2)(a), (3) and (4) remove fees for specified documents and 

make amendments to fees for the recording or reuse of biometric information and to related fee 

exceptions. 

Regulations 4(b), 6(4)(c) (in part), 7(2) and (6) and 9(2)(b) and (5) provide powers for the 

Secretary of State to waive certain specified fees so as to remedy any detriment connected with 

immigration or nationality which the Secretary of State considers an individual to have suffered as 

a result of maladministration by the Home Office. 

The amendments made by regulations 5(3)(a) to (d) and 6(3) set fees for applications for entry 

clearance to enter, and limited leave to remain in, the United Kingdom under a number of new 

Appendices to the United Kingdom immigration rules. They also remove fees for applications for 

entry clearance and limited leave to remain under Appendix Intra-Company Routes, which has 

been removed from the rules. Regulation 11 makes related saving provision to preserve fees for 

applications by dependants of applicants under former Appendix Intra-Company Routes. 

Regulation 5(3)(e) sets a new fee for applications for entry clearance and indefinite leave to enter 

the United Kingdom as a foreign or Commonwealth citizen discharged from HM Forces. These 

applications are provided for by Appendix Armed Forces to the United Kingdom immigration 

rules. There is already a fee in the 2018 Regulations which covers applications for indefinite leave 

to remain under that Appendix. Amendments made by regulations 5(5)(b) and 6(4)(c) (in part) and 

(5) provide exceptions to the new fee and the existing fee in specified circumstances. Regulation 

5(2) and (4) makes related amendments to an existing fee for applications by dependants of 

members of HM Forces, to take account of the fact that the applications in question under 

Appendix Armed Forces are for entry clearance as well as indefinite leave to enter the United 

Kingdom. 

Regulation 5(5)(a) removes a fee exception relating to applications for visit visas to attend the 

26th United Nations Climate Change Conference of the Parties (COP26) in 2021, which is no 

longer required. 

Regulation 6(2) and (4)(a) makes amendments to Schedule 2 to the 2018 Regulations to take 

account of the replacement of existing provisions of the United Kingdom immigration rules with 

new Appendix Private Life and related matters. 

Regulation 6(4)(b) amends an existing fee exception and an existing waiver covering applications 

for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom by qualifying residents of Grenfell Tower and 

Grenfell Walk. The amendments extend the exception and waiver to applications for indefinite 

leave to remain. 

Regulation 6(4)(c), as well as providing the new fee exceptions and waiver mentioned above, also 

provides new fee exceptions for applications for limited leave to remain in the United Kingdom 

arising as a result of the variation by the Secretary of State of applications for indefinite leave to 

remain under specified provisions of the United Kingdom immigration rules. 

Regulation 8 amends Schedule 4 to the 2018 Regulations which sets fees relating to sponsorship 

of immigration applications, including fees for sponsor licences and the issuing of certificates of 

sponsorship in connection with applications. The effect of the amendments is to set fees for 

licences to sponsor applicants under a number of new Appendices to the United Kingdom 



 19

immigration rules, for the issuing of certificates of sponsorship in respect of applications under 

those Appendices and for other services relating to sponsorship of applicants under those 

Appendices. Regulation 8 also removes sponsorship fees relating to applications under Appendix 

Intra-Company Routes, which has been removed from the United Kingdom immigration rules. 

Regulation 10 amends Schedule 9 to the 2018 Regulations to set a new fee for applications for 

entry clearance to enter the Isle of Man as a Worker (Seasonal) Migrant under the Isle of Man 

immigration rules. 

Regulation 12 and Schedule 2 modify provisions of the 2018 Regulations saved by previous 

amending instruments. The effect is to make changes to the fees payable by dependants which 

were preserved by way of saving provisions when amendments were made to provisions setting 

fees payable by main applicants. 

No impact assessment has been produced in respect of the amendments made by these Regulations 

to the 2011 Order because no impact, or no significant impact, on the private, voluntary or public 

sector is foreseen. 

A full impact assessment has been produced in respect of the amendments to the 2018 

Regulations. It is available alongside these Regulations on www.legislation.gov.uk and copies are 

also available from the Home Office, Fees and Income Planning Team, 2 Marsham Street, 

London, SW1P 4DF. 
  

  

© Crown copyright 2022 

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Jeff James, 

Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery Office and Queen’s Printer of Acts of Parliament. 



£6.90 

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2022/296 

 


