
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No. 101

The Civil Procedure (Amendment) Rules 2022

Amendment of Part 45

13. In rule 45.29E—
(a) in Table 6C, in Section A, in the entry for “agreed damages”, in the second column, for

“£1,000” substitute “£1,500”; and
(b) in Table 6D, in Section A, in the entry for “agreed damages”, in the second column, for

“£1,000” substitute “£1,500”.


