
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk editorial team to The
Court Fees (Miscellaneous Amendments) Order 2021. Any changes that have already been made by the team appear

in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 985

The Court Fees (Miscellaneous Amendments) Order 2021

PART 3
Amendment of Help with Fees Income Thresholds

Amendment of the Help with Fees Income Thresholds

8.—(1)  The following provisions of the Orders listed in paragraph (4) are amended as follows.
(2)  In paragraph 11 (remission of fees – gross monthly income)—

(a) after sub-paragraph (1)(b), for Table 2 substitute—

“Table 2

Column 1

Number of children of party

Column 2

Single

Column 3

Couple
no children £1,170 £1,345

1 child £1,435 £1,610

2 children £1,700 £1,875”

(b) in sub-paragraph (2) for “£245” substitute “£265”.
(3)  In paragraph 12 (gross monthly income cap)—

(a) after sub-paragraph (1)(b), for Table 3 substitute—

“Table 3

Column 1

Number of children of party

Column 2

Single

Column 3

Couple
no children £5,170 £5,345

1 child £5,435 £5,610

2 children £5,700 £5,875”

(b) in sub-paragraph (2), for “£245” substitute “£265”.
(4)  The provisions listed in this paragraph are—

(a) Schedule 1A to the Non-Contentious Probate Fees Order 2004(1) (remissions and part
remissions);

(1) S.I. 2004/3120. The relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2013/2302.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2004/3120
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2302


Document Generated: 2024-05-25
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk editorial team to The

Court Fees (Miscellaneous Amendments) Order 2021. Any changes that have already been made by the team appear
in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

(b) the Schedule to the Gender Recognition (Application Fees) Order 2006(2) (remissions and
part remissions);

(c) Schedule 2 to the Court of Protection Fees Order 2007(3) (remissions and part remissions);
(d) Schedule 2 to the Magistrates’ Courts Fees Order 2008(4) (remissions and part

remissions);
(e) Schedule 2 to the Civil Proceedings Fees Order 2008(5) (remissions and part remissions);
(f) Schedule 2 to the Family Proceedings Fees Order 2008(6) (remissions and part

remissions);
(g) Schedule 2 to the Supreme Court Fees Order 2009(7) (remissions and part remissions);
(h) Schedule 2 to the Upper Tribunal (Lands Chamber) Fees Order 2009(8) (remissions and

part remissions);
(i) Schedule 2 to the First-tier Tribunal (Gambling) Fees Order 2010(9) (remissions and part

remissions);
(j) Schedule 2 to the Upper Tribunal (Immigration and Asylum) (Judicial Review) (England

and Wales) Fees Order 2011(10) (remissions and part remissions);
(k) Schedule 1 to the First-tier Tribunal (Immigration and Asylum Chamber) Fees Order

2011(11) (remissions and part remissions);
(l) Schedule 2 to the First-tier Tribunal (Property Chamber) Fees Order 2013(12) (remissions

and part remissions).

Commencement Information
I1 Art. 8 in force at 30.9.2021, see art. 1

(2) S.I. 2006/758. The relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2013/2302.
(3) S.I. 2007/1745. The relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2013/2302.
(4) S.I. 2008/1052. The relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2013/2302.
(5) S.I. 2008/1053. The relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2013/2302.
(6) S.I. 2008/1054. The relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2013/2302.
(7) S.I. 2009/2131. The relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2013/2302.
(8) S.I. 2009/1114. The relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2013/2302.
(9) S.I. 2010/42. The relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2013/2302.
(10) S.I. 2011/2344. The relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2013/2302.
(11) S.I. 2011/2841. The relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2020/314.
(12) S.I. 2013/1179. The relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2013/2302.

2

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/985/article/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/758
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2302
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2007/1745
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2302
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/1052
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2302
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/1053
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2302
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/1054
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2302
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2009/2131
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2302
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2009/1114
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2302
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/42
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2302
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/2344
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2302
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/2841
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/314
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/1179
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2302


Changes to legislation: 
There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk editorial team to The Court
Fees (Miscellaneous Amendments) Order 2021. Any changes that have already been made by the
team appear in the content and are referenced with annotations.
View outstanding changes

Changes and effects yet to be applied to :
– art. 8(4)(g) revoked by S.I. 2024/148 Sch. 3

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/148
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/148/schedule/3

