
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Court
Fees (Miscellaneous Amendments) Order 2021, Section 5. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 985

The Court Fees (Miscellaneous Amendments) Order 2021

PART 2
Amendment of Court Fees

Amendment of the Magistrates’ Courts Fees Order 2008

5.—(1)  The table in Schedule 1 to the Magistrates’ Courts Fees Order 2008(1) (fees to be taken)
is amended as follows.

(2)  In the entry for fee 2.1 (on an application to state a case for the opinion of the High Court),
in column 2, for “£135” substitute “£137”.

(3)  In the entry for fee 2.3 (proceedings under Schedule 5 to the Licensing Act 2003), in column
2, for “£60” substitute “£62”.

(4)  In the entry for fee 2.4 (on commencing an appeal where no other fee is specified), in column
2, for “£60” substitute “£62”.

(5)  In the entry for fee 3.2 (register of judgments, orders and fines kept under section 98 of the
Courts Act 2003(2)), in column 2, for “£15” substitute “£16”.

(6)  In the entry for fee 5.1(a) (on a request for a copy document of ten pages or less), in column
2, for “£10” substitute “£11”.

(7)  In the entry for fee 5.2 (on a request for a copy of a document on a computer disk or in other
electronic form), in column 2, for “£10” substitute “£11”.

(8)  In the entry for fee 6.1 (on a request for a licence, consent or authority where no other fee is
specified), in column 2, for “£25” substitute “£27”.

(9)  In the entry for fee 6.2 (on an application for the renewal or variation of an existing licence),
in column 2, for “£25” substitute “£27”.

(10)  In the entry for fee 6.3 (on an application for the revocation of a licence where no other fee
is specified), in column 2, for “£25” substitute “£27”.

(11)  In the entry for fee 7.1 (on taking the attestation of a constable or special constable under
the Police Act 1996), in column 2, for “£10” substitute “£11”.

(12)  In the entry for fee 7.2 (for every oath, affirmation, solemn declaration or statutory
declaration where no other fee is specified), in column 2, for “£25” substitute “£27”.

(13)  In the entry for fee 8.2(a) (on an application for leave or permission to commence
proceedings where no other fee is specified), in column 2, for “£116” substitute “£125”.

(14)  In the entry for fee 8.2(b) (on commencing proceedings where leave or permission has been
granted following payment of fee 8.2(a)), in column 2, for “£116” substitute “£125”.

(1) S.I. 2008/1052 (L. 4). Relevant amending instruments are S.I. 2014/875, 2016/807, 2019/1063 and 2020/100.
(2) 2003 c. 39. Section 98 is amended by section 107(3) of, paragraph 55 of Schedule 8 and paragraph 15 of Schedule 16 to,

the Tribunals, Courts and Enforcement Act 2007 (c. 15) and by paragraph 40(a) and (c) of Part 2 of Schedule 9 to the Crime
and Courts Act 2013 (c. 22).

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/1052
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2014/875
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/807
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/1063
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/100
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2003/39
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2007/15
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2013/22


Document Generated: 2024-05-29
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Court
Fees (Miscellaneous Amendments) Order 2021, Section 5. (See end of Document for details)

(15)  In the entry for fee 9.1 (on an application for a warrant of entry), in column 2, for “£20”
substitute “£22”.

(16)  In the entry for fee 9.2 (on an application for any other warrant where no other fee is
specified), in column 2, for “£75” substitute “£81”.

(17)  In the entry for fee 10.1 (on an application for a warrant for commitment made in proceedings
under the Council Tax (Administration and Enforcement) Regulations 1992 or the Non-Domestic
Rating (Collection and Enforcement) (Local Lists) Regulations 1989), in column 2, for “£245”
substitute “£264”.

(18)  in the entry for fee 10.2 (on the application for a warrant for commitment made in
proceedings under the Child Support Act 1991), in column 2, for “£40” substitute “£41”.

Commencement Information
I1 Art. 5 in force at 30.9.2021, see art. 1

2

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/985/article/1


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Court Fees (Miscellaneous
Amendments) Order 2021, Section 5.


