
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 29

The Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed
Requirements) (England) (Amendment) Regulations 2021

Amendment of Schedule 2

7.—(1)  Schedule 2 (applicable amounts) is amended as follows.
(2)  In the Table in paragraph 1 (personal allowance)—

(a) in paragraph (1)—
(i) in column (1) after “pensionable age” insert “before 1st April 2021”;

(ii) in column (2) for “£187.75” substitute “£191.15”;
(b) in paragraph (2)—

(i) in column (1) after “pensionable age” insert “before 1st April 2021”;
(ii) in column (2) for “£280.85” substitute “£286.05”;

(c) in paragraph (3)—
(i) in column (1) after “pensionable age” insert “before 1st April 2021”;

(ii) in column (2)—
(aa) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£280.85” substitute “£286.05”;
(bb) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£93.10” substitute “£94.90”;

(d) at the end of the Table insert—

“(4) Single applicant or lone parent who has
attained pensionable age on or after 1st April
2021

£177.10

(5) Couple where both members have attained
pensionable age on or after 1st April 2021

£270.30

(6) If the applicant is a member of a polygamous
marriage and all members of the marriage have
attained pensionable age on or after 1st April
2021—

(a) for the applicant and the other party to the
marriage;

(a) £270.30

(b) for each additional spouse who is a member
of the same household as the applicant

(b) £93.20.”.

(3)  In column (2) of the Table in paragraph 2(1) (child or young person amounts), in paragraphs
(a) and (b), for “£68.27” substitute “£68.60”.

(4)  In paragraph 3(a) for “£17.45” substitute “£17.65”.
(5)  In the second column of the Table in Part 4 (amounts of premium specified in Part 3)—



Document Generated: 2023-05-19
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(a) in paragraph (1)(a) and (b)(i) for “£66.95” substitute “£67.30”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(b)(ii) for “£133.90” substitute “£134.60”;
(c) in paragraph (2) for “£26.60” substitute “£26.67”;
(d) in paragraph (3) for “£65.52” substitute “£65.94”;
(e) in paragraph (4) for “£37.50” substitute “£37.70”.

2


