STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 271
SOCIAL SECURITY

The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers” Compensation) (Payment of
Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2021

Made - - - - 8th March 2021
Coming into force - - Ist April 2021

The Secretary of State for Work and Pensions makes the following Regulations, in exercise of the
powers conferred by sections 1(1), (2) and (4) and 7(1) and (2) of the Pneumoconiosis etc.
(Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979(a).

In accordance with section 7(3)(b) of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act
1979, a draft of this instrument was laid before, and approved by, a resolution of each House of
Parliament.

Citation, commencement and application
1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation)
(Payment of Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2021 and come into force on 1st April 2021.

(2) These Regulations apply only in relation to any case in which a person first fulfils the
conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation)
Act 1979 on or after 1st April 2021.

Amendment of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims)
Regulations 1988

2.—(1) The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims) Regulations
1988(c) are amended as follows.

(2) In the proviso to regulation 5(1) (payment where death results from diffuse mesothelioma)
for “£3,305” substitute “£3,322”.

(3) In regulation 6(1)(a) (payment where pneumoconiosis is accompanied by tuberculosis) for
“£6,838” (in both places) substitute “£6,872”.

(4) In regulation 8 (minimum amount payable to dependant) for “£3,305 substitute “£3,322”.
(5) In the Schedule—

(a) in the part headed “TABLE 17, for the table after the preamble substitute—

(a) 1979 c. 41. Section 1 was amended by section 24 of the Social Security Act 1985 (c. 53).
(b) Section 7(3) was amended by section 58 of the Welfare Reform Act 2007 (c. 5).
(c) S.I. 1988/668; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1989/552, 2015/503, S.1. 2020/242.



0SS°6¢ 61LLE 90L°S¢ Y0S €€ LTIIE €96°8C Y0LTT €1E81 ogcl SOS‘L 19
(4% 47 18¥°Ch (415017 00¥°8¢ 91°9¢ LTE€EE 0¥9°9¢ €VL'1T 98T°C1 08¢°8 09
990°61 6ET°LY 91¢Sy 10¢°ey S61°1Y 780°8¢ 6L50€ CLIGT 0ICTLI Sve6 65
678°€S 866°1S 9T1°0S 10T°8Y YET O vr8TY 60S € €19°8T Ser'6l PITOI 8¢
L8S'8S €9L°96 €E6' VS L60°€S 8916 Y19°'Ly 6vP 8¢ 0T ¥S0°1T L86°01 LS
81709 L8S8S €9L°9¢ €E6'1S L60°ES €08°61 S10°1¥ TL6'VE PreeT [45%4| 9¢
85TT9 8109 L8S8S €9L°9G €E6'1S L66°1S 9LS‘eY S06°LE 9€9°GT 14289 Y
S80°v9 86TT9 81¥°09 L8S8S €9L°96 961°%¢ LY1°9¥ 8T8 0¥ vT6°LT L96' V1 123
€16°S9 S80'19 85TT9 81709 L8S8S €6£°9S 0L 81 8SLEY SIT0¢E 6791 €S
TrL'LY €16°S9 S80°v9 86TT9 8109 L8S'8S L9T1S 06991 667C€ €T9°L1 [4Y
TIeoL 0889 %999 vE8 19 L86°T9 98L°09 961°1S 119°8% T8LEE €v0'61 IS
€L8TL 6€0°1L 01T°69 T8€°L9 LYS S9 L86°C9 8CTILS TLS0S #90°G€ 19+°0¢C 0S
OvP'SL LO9EL SLL'TL £v6°69 IT1°89 981°69 95009 6SYTS SreE9¢E 188°1C (Y4
€00°8L S91°9L 6EC VL 60SCTL €L9°0L 78¢°L9 L86°T9 €8E VS LTY'LE 00€°€T 81
796°08 TELSL ¥06°9L 990°GL eveEL 08569 €16°S9 00€°9¢ 806°8¢ 1TLYT Ly
LLY18 9'6L 618°LL 986°GL 8ST VL 798°0L T8E°L9 6CL'8S SI1°Th L9€°9T 9%
¥6£°C8 79508 TEL'8L Y06°9L 990°GL Yr1°CL S8°89 SI°19 91¢'SH S10°8¢ 9%
90¢°€8 LLY18 w96L 618°LL 986°GL €TrEL TIEoL 9L5°€9 0TS‘8P 659°6C 144
LTTV8 v6£C8 796°08 TELSL Y06°9L LOLYL SLLIL L0099 LIS T1€°1€ 13917
0OP1°68 90¢°€8 LLY18 9'6L 618°LL 986°GL EvTEL 1€7°89 €E6'1S 1S6C¢ (4%
1.6°98 0r1°68 90¢°¢c8 LLY'1S w9'6L 6I8°LL vSI°GL 798°0L 9L9°LS 960v¢ 184
708°88 1,698 0OP1°G8 90¢°€8 LLY18 wo6L I80°LL v8TEL 8109 9S1°GE oy
£€9°06 70888 1,698 0r1°68 L90°¢8 08+°18 LOO'6L OTL'SL L9T1°€9 16T°9¢ 6¢
€ov°T6 £€9°06 708°88 1,698 0¥1°68 90¢°¢c8 7€6°08 9¢1°8L €16°S9 0S€°LE 8¢
96716 €9v°T6 £€9°06 0888 1,698 0OP1°68 €68°C8 795°08 $99°89 6vY'8¢ | Iopun .o L¢
F F F F F F F F F F
%001 - %06~ %08~ WOL~ %09- %OS- %Ot~ WOE- WOC- 4opun 40
BI6 WIS WBIL W19 WIS BIY WIE BIT BIT WOl uosiad
pa1qosip
poriad juvaajad ayj 40f JudUISSISSD ISDIUIILIJ Jo a3y,




W I1S9P1 191°¢€1 9¢1°C1 rr9°01 vS1°6 vTI'g 7679 019°¢ 9LSY Teee 19A0 10 [/,
SSI°S1 €19°¢l 867°CI vL8°01 L8E'6 09T°8 1€¥°9 869°C 999t 01¥°€¢ 9L
T89°¢C1 9L0V1 €98°C1 001°T1 €19'6 86¢°8 8959 T6L'S SILY Y0S°¢ SL
9r1°91 €esyl eTel 1€ET1 08°6 0S8 80L9 788°C 4S04 765°€ YL
79991 €66 71 L6S°ET 65511 TLO01 TL9'8 789 SL6'S 96t 189°¢ €L
691°LI 9pSl 096°¢€1 S8LIT 20€°01 7188 7869 $90°9 Se0’s 8LL'E L
19L°LT ¥20°91 9911 €9€CI T08°01 LLT°6 vre'L L1€9 91T°¢ 768°¢ IL
LSE8I 76591 L96V1 vE6°TI T0¢ 11 9S°6 vIL'L 8959 Sor's S00'y 0L
9v6'81 691°LI 0LY'ST LOSET T18°T1 r16'6 080°8 €789 $SY 121y 69
Sye61 SEL'LT 9L6°G1 9L0Y1 TIeTl 6LC°01 6178 TLOL T9L°S 1€TY 89
10T €re8l LLY*91 191 128°C1 r¥9°01 TI88 12€°L 166°S 1S€Y L9
1L0°€C ovT1T 09¢€°61 ovv'L1 0LY'S1 9LT' €1 T08°01 7€8°8 1S0°L 608t 99
100°9 IL1'¥C 8¥CTC €€T°0C 9TI°81 01661 L6LCI rreol 6v1°8 99T°¢ S9
976'8C S60°LT 1€1°6C LT0°€T €8L°0C 9€6°81 YL Y1 CS8'11 S7A TEL'S 9
6S8°1¢ 920°0¢ S10°8¢ 918°CC €EY'ET YLIIT 6LL91 r9€°€l rreol 081°9 €9
06L¥€ 166°C€ 106°0€ €19°8¢ 160°9C €08°€T S9L'81 LLSYT EPPIl 9€9°9 9




(b) in the part headed “TABLE 2”, for the table after the preamble substitute—

“Part A
Age of Percentage assessment for the relevant period
disabled
person on 10% 11%-20% 21%-30% 31%-49% 50% or over
th-eir last or under £ £ £ £ £
birthday
before their
death
37 or under 24,353 41,523 46,556 47,931 49,073
38 23,804 39,964 45,180 46,556 48,018
39 23,257 38,408 43,808 45,179 46,965
40 22,703 36,848 42,434 43,808 45,913
41 22,154 35,294 41,061 42,434 44,860
42 21,610 33,743 39,686 41,061 43,808
43 20,619 31,727 38,450 39,823 42,800
44 19,637 29,706 37,211 38,590 41,784
45 18,654 27,694 35,977 37,352 40,783
46 17,668 25,678 34,635 36,116 39,777
47 16,685 23,665 33,511 34,885 38,772
48 15,932 23,114 32,596 33,922 37,536
49 15,171 22,564 31,677 32,960 36,297
50 14,419 22,015 30,764 31,993 35,063
51 13,665 21,467 29,849 31,038 33,831
52 12,910 20,920 28,932 30,076 32,596
53 12,564 19,637 27,195 28,747 31,583
54 12,221 18,354 25,451 27,420 30,580
55 11,880 17,072 23,712 26,094 29,573
56 11,537 15,791 21,971 24,768 28,559
57 10,987 14,513 20,233 23,438 27,555
58 10,114 13,593 18,245 21,107 24,768
59 9,245 12,676 16,254 18,767 21,971
60 8,380 11,768 14,258 16,434 19,182
61 7,505 10,848 12,270 14,100 16,389
62 6,636 9,937 10,275 11,768 13,593
63 6,180 9,866 10,143 11,326 12,795
64 5,732 9,245 9,999 10,894 12,003
65 5,266 8,149 9,866 10,458 11,191
66 4,809 7,051 8,834 10,025 10,392
67 or over 3,322 4,576 5,610 6,292 8,124
Part B
Age of disabled person on their last birthday | Payment £
before their death
37 or under 49,073
38 48,018
39 46,965
40 45,913
41 44,860




42 43,808
43 42,800
44 41,784
45 40,783
46 39,777
47 38,772
48 37,536
49 36,297
50 35,063
51 33,831
52 32,596
53 31,583
54 30,580
55 29,573
56 28,559
57 27,555
58 24,768
59 21,971
60 19,182
61 16,389
62 13,593
63 12,795
64 12,003
65 11,191
66 10,392
67 or over 8,124,

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Work and Pensions

Justin Tomlinson
Minister of State
8th March 2021 Department for Work and Pensions

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

Under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979 (c. 41) (“the Act”) lump sum
payments may be made to certain persons disabled by a disease to which the Act applies, or to
dependants of persons who were so disabled before they died. The diseases to which the Act
applies are pneumoconiosis, byssinosis, diffuse mesothelioma, primary carcinoma of the lung
(where accompanied by asbestosis or diffuse pleural thickening) and diffuse pleural thickening.

These Regulations amend the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims)
Regulations 1988 (S.I. 1988/668) (“the 1988 Regulations”). The amendments made by regulation
2 have the effect of increasing the amounts payable under the 1988 Regulations. The increase in
each case is 0.5 per cent rounded up or down to the nearest £1 as appropriate.

By virtue of regulation 1(2), the amendments made by these Regulations apply only in relation to
any case in which a person first fulfils the conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Act on
or after 1st April 2021.

A full impact assessment has not been produced for this instrument as no, or no significant, impact
on the private, voluntary or public sector is foreseen.




© Crown copyright 2021

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Jeff James,
Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery Office and Queen’s Printer of Acts of Parliament.






ISBN 978-0-34-822120-6
£6.90
http://www legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/271

9"780348"221206




