
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 405

The Social Fund Funeral Expenses Payment
(Coronavirus) (Amendment) Regulations 2020

Amendments to the Social Fund Maternity and Funeral Expenses (General) Regulations
2005

2. In the Social Fund Maternity and Funeral Expenses (General) Regulations 2005(1), in
regulation 9 (amount of funeral payment)—

(a) in paragraph (3)(g), for “£700” substitute “£1,000”; and
(b) in paragraph (10)(b), for “£700” substitute “£1,000”.

(1) S.I. 2005/3061.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2005/3061

