
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 307

The Gambling Act 2005 (Variation
of Monetary Limits) Order 2020

Variation of limits in section 99(3) of the Gambling Act 2005

2.—(1)  Subsection (3) of section 99 of the Act (mandatory conditions of lottery operating
licence)(1) is amended as follows.

(2)  In paragraph (a), for “£4,000,000” substitute “£5,000,000”.
(3)  In paragraph (b), for “£10,000,000” substitute “£50,000,000”.

(1) Paragraph (a) of section 99(3) was amended by S.I. 2009/207.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2009/207

