
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No. 337

The Small Charitable Donations Act (Amendment) Order 2019

Amendment of the Small Charitable Donations Act 2012

2.—(1)  The Schedule to the Small Charitable Donations Act 2012 (meaning of “small donation”:
conditions)(1) is amended as follows.

(2)  In paragraph 1 (small cash or contactless payment)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (1) for “£20” substitute “£30”, and
(b) in sub-paragraph (2) for “£20” substitute “£30”.

(1) Paragraph 1 of the Schedule was amended by Section 2(2) of the Small Charitable Donations and Childcare Payments Act
2017 (c. 1).

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/1

