
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2018 No. 322

The Co-operative and Community Benefit Societies Act
2014 (Amendments to Audit Requirements) Order 2018

Amendments to the Co-operative and Community Benefit Societies Act 2014

2. In section 84(1) of the Co-operative and Community Benefit Societies Act 2014 (power of
certain societies to disapply section 83)—

(a) in paragraph (a), for “£2,800,000” substitute “£5,100,000”;
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£5,600,000” substitute “£10,200,000”.


