
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2015 No. 998

The Legislative Reform (Community
Governance Reviews) Order 2015

Requirements for a community governance petition

3. In section 80(3) (community governance petitions)—
(a) in paragraph (a) for “50%” substitute “37.5%”;
(b) in paragraph (b) for “250” substitute “187”; and
(c) in paragraph (c) for “10%” substitute “7.5%”.


