
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2015 No. 567

The Child Benefit and Tax Credits Up-rating Order 2015

Amendment of the Child Tax Credit Regulations 2002

3.—(1)  Regulation 7 of the Child Tax Credit Regulations 2002(1) (determination of the maximum
rate) is amended as follows.

(2)  In paragraph (4)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (c) for “£2,750” substitute “£2,780”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (f) for “£2,750” substitute “£2,780”.

(1) S.I. 2002/2007; the last relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2014/384.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2002/2007
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2014/384

