
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2014 No. 2114

The Motor Vehicles (Tests) (Amendment) Regulations 2014

Fees for examinations

3.—(1)  Regulation 20 is amended as follows.
(2)  In paragraph (1)(e)(i), for “£132” substitute “£128”.
(3)  In paragraph (1)(e)(ii), for “£139” substitute “£163”.
(4)  In paragraph (1)(ea)(i), for “£106” substitute “£103”.
(5)  In paragraph (1)(ea)(ii), for “£111” substitute “£127”.
(6)  In paragraph (4) in the Table, for each amount specified both in that Table and in column (a)

in the following Table in relation to each type of fee, substitute the amount specified in column (b)
of the following Table in relation to that amount.

Table

(1)

Normal Fee(£)

(2)

Out of Hours Fee(£)

(3)

Designated Premises
Fee(£)

(4)

Out of Hours at
Designated Premises
Fee (£)

(a)

Existing
Amount

(b)

SubstitutedAmount

(a)

Existing
Amount

(b)

SubstitutedAmount

(a)

Existing
Amount

(b)

SubstitutedAmount

(a)

Existing
Amount

(b)

Substituted
Amount

63 79 88 104 59 56 84 81

139 163 191 215 132 128 184 180

44 54 63 73 41 39 60 58

111 127 149 165 106 103 144 141


