
S T A T U T O R Y  I N S T R U M E N T S  

2014 No. 1791 

REGISTRATION OF BIRTHS, DEATHS, MARRIAGES 

ETC., ENGLAND AND WALES 

The Marriage of Same Sex Couples (Registration of Buildings 

and Appointment of Authorised Persons) (Amendment) 

Regulations 2014 

Made - - - - 7th July 2014 

Laid before Parliament 10th July 2014 

Coming into force - - 1st September 2014 

The Secretary of State, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 43D(1) and (2) of the 

Marriage Act 1949(a), makes the following Regulations: 

Citation and commencement 

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Marriage of Same Sex Couples (Registration of 

Buildings and Appointment of Authorised Persons) (Amendment) Regulations 2014 and come 

into force on 1st September 2014. 

Amendments 

2. The Marriage of Same Sex Couples (Registration of Buildings and Appointment of 

Authorised Persons) Regulations 2014(b), are amended as follows— 

(a) in regulation 4(2)(d)(ii), for “£120.00”, substitute “£123.00”; and 

(b) in regulation 9(e), for “£120.00”(c), substitute “£123.00”.  

 

 

 

Home Office James Brokenshire 

7th July 2014 Minister of State 

 

 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) 1949 c. 76.  Section 43D was inserted by section 4(2) of, and paragraph 2 of Schedule 1 to, the Marriage (Same Sex 

Couples) Act 2013 (c. 30). 
(b) S.I. 2014/106 
(c) Regulation 9(e) refers to the fee under section 41(6) Marriage Act 1949, which is also amended from 1 September 2014 by 

an Order under section 5 Public Expenditure and Receipts Act 1968 (c. 14).   



 2 

£4.25 

UK201407089   07/2014   19585 

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2014/1791 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Regulations) 

These Regulations amend the Marriage of Same Sex Couples (Registration of Buildings and 

Appointment of Authorised Persons) Regulations 2014 (“the principal Regulations”) to increase a 

fee for the registration of buildings for the solemnization of marriages of same sex couples, under 

section 43A of the Marriage Act 1949, from £120 to £123. 

This increase is made in parallel with other amendments to fees (made in a separate Order under 

the Public Expenditure and Receipts Act 1968), and mirrors the amendment to the fee under 

section 41(6) of the Marriage Act 1949 for the registration of buildings for the solemnization of 

marriages between a man and a woman. 

In consequence of the change to the fee under section 41(6), these Regulations also amend the 

reference to that fee in regulation 9 of the principal Regulations.  Regulation 9 modifies the 

application of section 41 where an application for registration is made under that section in respect 

of a building that is already registered under section 43A. 

A full impact assessment has not been produced for this instrument as no impact on the private or 

voluntary sectors is foreseen. 
  

  

© Crown copyright 2014 

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Carol Tullo, 

Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery Office and Queen’s Printer of Acts of Parliament. 


