
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2014 No. 147

The Welfare Benefits Up-rating Order 2014

Amounts for the JSA Regulations 2013

10. In regulation 49 of the JSA Regulations 2013 (weekly amounts of jobseeker’s allowance)—
(a) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£56.80” substitute “£57.35”; and
(b) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£71.70” substitute “£72.40”.


