
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2013 No. 506

MENTAL CAPACITY, ENGLAND AND WALES

The Lasting Powers of Attorney, Enduring Powers of Attorney
and Public Guardian (Amendment) Regulations 2013

Made       -      -      -      - 5th March 2013

Laid before Parliament 11th March 2013

Coming into force 1st April 2013

THE LASTING POWERS OF ATTORNEY,
ENDURING POWERS OF ATTORNEY AND PUBLIC
GUARDIAN (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2013

1. Citation and commencement  
2. Amendments to the Lasting Powers of Attorney, Enduring Powers of

Attorney and Public Guardian Regulations 2007
 

3. In regulation 12, for “6 weeks” substitute “4 weeks”.  
4. In regulation 14(2), for “5 weeks” substitute “3 weeks”.  
5. In regulation 14A(2), for “5 weeks” substitute “3 weeks”.  
6. In regulation 15(3), for “5 weeks” substitute “3 weeks”.  
7. After regulation 35(3), insert— (4) The Public Guardian must, if...  
8. In regulation 37— (a) after regulation 37(3) insert—  
9. In Schedule 1— (a) in Part 1, (“Form for instrument...  

10. In Schedule 2, in form LPA 001—  
11. In Part 1 of Schedule 4, in form LPA 003A...  
12. In Part 2 of Schedule 4, in form LPA 003B...  
13. Transitional arrangements  

  Signature  
  Explanatory Note  


