
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2012 No. 304

The Road Vehicles (Registration and
Licensing) (Amendment) Regulations 2012

Amendments to Schedule 2 (Reduced pollution certificates and the reduced pollution
requirements)

3. In paragraph 13 (prescribed fees) of Schedule 2—
(a) in sub-paragraph (1)(a), for “£32” substitute “£34”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (1)(b), for “£19” substitute “£20”;
(c) after sub-paragraph (2), insert—

“(3)  If, at the request of the applicant, an examination is carried out otherwise than at
premises provided by the Secretary of State under section 52 of the 1988 Act(1) the fee
payable under sub-paragraph (1)(a) shall be reduced by £2, and the fee payable under sub-
paragraph (1)(b) shall be reduced by £1.”;

(d) for sub-paragraph (4), substitute—
“(4)  in sub-paragraph (2) “out of hours” means—

(a) at any time on Saturday, Sunday, Christmas Day, Good Friday or a Bank Holiday
(as defined by the Banking and Financial Dealings Act 1971(2)), or any other
day on which tests are not normally conducted at vehicle testing stations; or

(b) on any other day except between 6.00 am and 8.00 pm.”; and
(e) after sub-paragraph (4), add—

“(5)  Sub-paragraphs (2), (3) and (4) do not apply in Northern Ireland.”.

(1) 1988 c.52.
(2) 1971 c.80.

[DfT 00422]

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1988/52
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1971/80

