
Document Generated: 2023-08-26
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE 1

Amendments of Part 3 of the Criminal Law (Consolidation) (Scotland) Act 1995

Increase of maximum period of detention under section 24 from 6 to 12 hours

5.—(1)  Section 24 (detention and questioning at office of Revenue and Customs) is amended
as follows.

(2)  In subsection (2)—
(a) for “Detention” substitute “Subject to section 24A, detention”;
(b) for “six hours” substitute “12 hours”.

(3)  In subsection (4), for “six hours” substitute “12 hours”.

1


