Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2010 No. 2863

The Apportionment of Money in the National
Lottery Distribution Fund Order 2010

Apportionment of Money in the National Lottery Distribution Fund

3.—(1) Section 22(3) of the National Lottery etc. Act 1993 (apportionment of money in
Distribution Fund) is amended as follows with effect from the beginning of 1 April 2012.

(2) In paragraph (a) for “18 per cent.” substitute “20 per cent.”.
(3) In paragraph (b) for “18 per cent.” substitute “20 per cent.”.
(4) In paragraph (c) for “18 per cent.” substitute “20 per cent.”.
(5) In paragraph (d) for “46 per cent.” substitute “40 per cent.”.



