
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2009 No. 880

The Road Vehicles (Registration and
Licensing) (Amendment) Regulations 2009

Amendments to Schedule 2 (reduced pollution certificates and the reduced pollution
requirements)

3. In paragraph 13 of Schedule 2—
(a) in sub-paragraph (1)(a), for “£29” substitute “£32”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (1)(b), for “£17” substitute “£19”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (2), for “£11” substitute “£12”; and
(d) in sub-paragraph (3) for “£7” substitute “£3”.

[DfT 00184]


