
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2009 No. 1496

The Magistrates’ Courts Fees (Amendment) Order 2009

Citation and commencement

1.—(1)  This Order may be cited as the Magistrates’ Courts Fees (Amendment) Order 2009.
(2)  Except as provided in paragraph (3), this Order comes into force on 13th July 2009.
(3)  Fee 8.1(b) of Schedule 1 set out in the Schedule to this Order comes into force on 1st

September 2009.

Amendment of the Magistrates’ Courts Fees Order 2008

2. The Magistrates’ Courts Fees Order 2008 (1) is amended as follows.

3. For Schedule 1 (which specifies the fees to be taken in magistrates’ courts), substitute
Schedule 1 (Fees to be taken) set out in the Schedule to this Order.

4. In paragraph 1(1)(c) of Schedule 2, for “626” substitute “26”.

5. In paragraph 3(1) of Schedule 2, in column 2 —
(a) for “£12,000” substitute “£13,000”;
(b) for “£14,735” substitute “£15,930”;
(c) for “£17,470” substitute “£18,860”;
(d) for “£20,205” substitute “£21,790”; and
(e) for “£22,940” substitute “£24,720”.

6. In paragraph 3(1) of Schedule 2, in column 3 —
(a) for “£16,000” substitute “£18,000”;
(b) for “£18,735” substitute “£20,930”;
(c) for “£21,470” substitute “£23,860”;
(d) for “£24,205” substitute “£26,790”; and
(e) for “£26,940” substitute “£29,720”.

7. In paragraph 3(2) of Schedule 2, for “£2,735” substitute “£2,930”.

8. In paragraph 5(3) of Schedule 2 —
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£296” substitute “£315”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£228” substitute “£244”; and
(c) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£150” substitute “£159”.

(1) S.I. 2008/1052 (L.4), amended by S.I. 2008/2855 (L.21).

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/1052
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/2855


Document Generated: 2024-04-24
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Signed by authority of the Lord Chancellor

4th June 2009

Bridget Prentice
Parliamentary Under Secretary of State

Ministry of Justice

We consent,

10th June 2009

Tony Cunningham
Frank Roy

Two of the Lords Commissioners of Her
Majesty’s Treasury

2


