Document Generated: 2023-08-20
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE Regulation 2

AMENDMENT OF THE POLICE PENSIONS REGULATIONS 1987

Part 1

1. Inregulation A20 for the words “medical referee” there shall be substituted “board of medical
referees”.

2. In regulation H1(4) for the words “paragraphs 5(a) and 6 of schedule H” there is substituted
“paragraphs 5(1)(a) and (2) of Schedule H”.

(2) For regulation H1(5) there shall be substituted—

“(5) The decision of the selected medical practitioner on the question or questions
referred to him under this regulation shall be expressed in the form of a report and shall,
subject to regulations H2 and H3, be final.”

(3) For regulation H1(6) there shall be substituted—

“(6) A copy of any such report shall be supplied to the person who is the subject of
that report.”

(4) Regulation H1(7) shall be omitted.

3.—(1) For the heading at regulation H2 (“Appeal to medical referee”) there shall be substituted
“Appeal to board of medical referees”.

(2) Regulation H2(1) and (2) shall be omitted.

(3) Inregulation H2(2A) for the words “regulation H1(6)” there shall be substituted “regulation
H1(5)”.

(4) Inregulation H2(2B) for the words “and the Secretary of State shall appoint a medical referee
to decide the appeal” there shall be substituted “and the police authority shall refer the appeal to a
board of medical referees, appointed in accordance with arrangements approved by the Secretary
of State, to decide”.

(5) Regulation H2(2A) shall be renumbered H2(1).
(6) Regulation H2(2B) shall be renumbered H2(2).
(7) Inregulation H2(3)—

(a) in each place where the words “medical referee” occur there shall be substituted “board
of medical referees”;

(b) for the words “certificate or report” there shall be substituted “report”;

(c) forthe words “certificate or as the case may be a report” there shall be substituted “report”;
(d) in each place where the word “he” occurs there shall be substituted “it”; and

(e) for the word “his” there shall be substituted “its”.

4.—(1) In regulation H3(1)—

(a) after the word “him” there shall be inserted “, or as the case may be it,”;

(b) after the word “his” there shall be inserted , or as the case may be its,”; and

(c) for the words “certificate or report as the case may be” there shall be substituted “report”.
(2) For regulation H3(2) there shall be substituted—



Document Generated: 2023-08-20
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

“(2) The police authority and the claimant may, by agreement, refer any final decision
of a medical authority who has given such a decision to him, or as the case may be it,
for reconsideration, and he, or as the case may be it, shall accordingly reconsider his, or
as the case may be its, decision and, if necessary, issue a fresh report, which, subject to
any further reconsideration under this paragraph or paragraph (1) or an appeal, where the
claimant requests that the appeal of which he has given notice (before referral of the decision
under this paragraph) be notified to the Secretary of State, under regulation H2, shall be
final.”

(3) In regulation H3(4) in each place where the words “medical referee” occur there shall be
substituted “board of medical referees”.

5. In regulation H4 in each place where the words “medical referee” occur there shall be
substituted “board of medical referees”.

6. In Schedule A (glossary of expressions)—
(a) the definition “medical referee” shall be omitted;

(b) after the definition “average pensionable pay” there shall be inserted the following
definition—

““pboard of medical referees” has the meaning assigned to it by paragraph 3(1) of
Schedule H;”; and

(c) after the definition “police authority” there shall be inserted the following definition—

(3173

public holiday” means Christmas Day, the 26th December (if it falls on a Saturday
or Sunday), the Ist January (if it so falls), Good Friday or a bank holiday;”.

7. For Schedule H (medical appeals) there shall be substituted the following schedule—

“Schedule H
(medical appeals)

1. Every notice of appeal under regulation H2(2A) and statement of grounds under
regulation H2(2B) shall be in writing.

2. On receiving a notice of appeal against a report issued under regulation H1 and the
appellant’s statement of grounds for appeal, the police authority, unless regulation H3(2)
applies, shall forward to the Secretary of State and a board of medical referees copies of
those documents and all other documents determined as necessary by the Secretary of State.

3.—(1) The board of medical referees shall consist of not less than three medical
practitioners appointed by, and in accordance with, arrangements approved by the Secretary
of State, provided that—

(a) at least one member of the board of medical referees shall be a specialist in a
medical condition relevant to the appeal;

(b) one member of the board of medical referees will be appointed chairman; and

(c) where there is an equality of voting among members of the board of medical
referees, the chairman shall have a second or casting vote.

(2) The board of medical referees shall appoint a time and place for hearing the appeal,
at which it may interview or examine the appellant, and for any such further hearings as it
may consider necessary and shall give not less than 2 months notice, or such shorter period
as the police authority and appellant may agree, thereof to the appellant and police authority.



Document Generated: 2023-08-20
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(3) The police authority and the appellant shall, not less than 35 days (including
weekends and public holidays) before the date appointed for the hearing, inform the board
of medical referees whether they intend to be represented at the hearing.

4.—(1) Where either party to the appeal intends to submit written evidence or a
written statement at a hearing arranged under paragraph 3 above that party shall, subject to
paragraph (2) submit it to the board of medical referees and the other party not less than 35
days before the date appointed for the hearing.

(2) Where any written evidence or statement has been submitted under paragraph (1),
any written evidence or statement in response may be submitted by the other party to the
board of medical referees and the party submitting the first-mentioned evidence or statement
at any time not less than 7 days before the date appointed for the hearing.

(3) The board of medical referees may postpone or adjourn the date appointed for the
hearing where any written evidence or statement is submitted in contravention of paragraphs
(1) or (2) or it appears necessary to do so for the proper determination of the appeal.

(4) References in paragraphs (1) and (2) to periods of days shall include weekends and
public holidays.

5.—(1) Any hearing (including any examination) may be attended by—
(a) the selected medical practitioner; and
(b) a duly qualified medical practitioner appointed for the purpose by the appellant,
although they may only observe any examination.

(2) If the selected medical practitioner does not attend any examination then a duly
qualified medical practitioner appointed for that purpose by the police authority may attend
the examination as an observer.

(3) If any hearing includes an examination then only medical practitioners may be
present for that part of the hearing.

6. The board of medical referees shall supply the police authority, the appellant and the
Secretary of State with a written statement of its decision. Where the board of medical
referees disagrees with any part of the selected medical practitioner’s report, the board of
medical referees shall supply a revised report.

7.—(1) There shall be paid to the board of medical referees—

(a) such fees as are determined in accordance with arrangements made by the
Secretary of State; or

(b) where no such arrangements have been made, such fees and allowances as the
Secretary of State may from time to time determine.

(2) Any fees and allowances payable to the board of medical referees under paragraph (1)
shall, subject to paragraph 8(2), be paid by the police authority and shall be treated as part
of the expenses of the police authority for the purposes of this Schedule.

8.—(1) Save as hereinafter provided, the expenses of each party to the appeal shall be
borne by that party.

(2) Where a hearing has been cancelled, adjourned or postponed at the request of, or
due to the actions or omissions of the police authority, less than 11 days before the hearing
(excluding weekends and public holidays) the board of medical referees shall require the
police authority to pay to the appellant any expenses actually and reasonably incurred by



Document Generated: 2023-08-20
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

him in respect of attending or arranging to attend the cancelled, adjourned or postponed
hearing as the case may be.

(3) Where the board of medical referees determines that a hearing has been cancelled,
adjourned or postponed at the request of, or due to the actions or omissions of the appellant,
less than 11 days before the hearing (excluding weekends and public holidays) the police
authority may, subject to paragraph (4), require the appellant to pay towards the cost of the
cancellation, adjournment or postponement as the case may be, such sum not exceeding
the total costs of the cancellation, adjournment or postponement as the case may be as the
authority thinks fit.

(4) If the board of medical referees, after taking account of any representations from
either party, decides that the cancellation, adjournment or postponement as the case may be
was not due to any fault on the part of the appellant and the appellant should not pay towards
the cost of the cancellation, adjournment or postponement as the case may be, it shall state
that this is the case and the police authority shall not require the payment of any such costs.

(5) Where the board of medical referees decides in favour of the police authority and
reports that in its opinion the appeal was frivolous or vexatious, the authority may, subject
to paragraph (6), require the appellant to pay towards the cost of the appeal such sum not
exceeding the board of medical referees' total fees and allowances as the authority thinks fit.

(6) If the board of medical referees, after taking account of any representations from
either party, decides there are exceptional reasons why the appellant should not pay towards
the cost of the appeal, it shall state that this is the case and the police authority shall not
require the payment of any such costs.

(7) Where the board of medical referees decides in favour of the appellant, the police
authority shall refund to the appellant any expenses actually and reasonably incurred by the
appellant in respect of attending any such hearing as is mentioned in paragraph 3.”

Part 2

8. In regulation A10(2)(h) after the words “unpaid maternity leave” there shall be inserted the
words “or unpaid parental leave”.

9.—(1) After regulation F1(1)(d) there shall be inserted—

“(da) any period of unpaid parental leave taken after 1st April 2003 in respect of which
the conditions specified in paragraph (1B) are not satisfied;”.

(2) In regulation F1(1B) after the words “in subparagraph (c)” there shall be inserted the words
“and (da)”.

(3) Inregulation F1(1B)(a) after each occurrence of the word “maternity” there shall be inserted
the words “or parental”.

(4) In regulation F1(1B)(b) after each occurrence of the words “unpaid maternity leave” there
shall be inserted the words “or unpaid parental leave”.

10. Inregulation F10(2)(b) for the words “2 years' pensionable service” there shall be substituted
“3 months' pensionable service”.

11. In regulation G1(3) for the words “sick leave or maternity leave” there shall be substituted
the words “sick leave, maternity leave or parental leave”.

12. In Schedule A (glossary of expressions)—

(a) for the definition “maternity leave” there shall be inserted the following definition—



Document Generated: 2023-08-20
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(3173

maternity leave” has the same meaning as in regulation 3 of the Police Regulations
2003(1)

(b) after the definition “overseas service” there shall be inserted the following definition—

13133

parental leave” means leave granted in accordance with regulation 33(8) of the
Police Regulations 2003;”.

Part 3

13. For regulation K4(1) there shall be substituted—

“(1) Subject to paragraph (2), a police authority by whom a pension is payable under Part
B of these Regulations or under regulation E1 (adult dependent relative’s special pension)
may, in their discretion, withdraw the whole or any part of the pension for any period during
which the pensioner is serving as a regular policeman in any police force, save that such
withdrawal shall not apply to any pension credit under Part M; and, where they have done
so, they shall be discharged from all actual or contingent liability in respect of the pension
or the part thereof withdrawn for the period in question.”

Part 4

14.—(1) In paragraph (c) of the proviso to regulation F1(1) (reckoning of pensionable service
during maternity leave) for the words “18 weeks” there are substituted the words “26 weeks”.

(2) Sub-paragraph (1) has effect in relation to any period of maternity leave falling on or after
6th April 2003.

(1) S.1.2003/527.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2003/527

