
15-08-00 02:44:555419091001 Pag Table: STATIN PPSysB Unit: PAG1

S T A T U T O R Y I N S T R U M E N T S

2000 No. 2149

MAGISTRATES’ COURTS, ENGLAND AND WALES

The Greater London Magistrates’ Courts Authority
(Constitution) (Amendment) Regulations 2000

Made - - - - - 3rd August 2000

Laid before Parliament 8th August 2000

Coming into force - - 1st September 2000

The Lord Chancellor, in exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 30B of the Justices
of the Peace Act 1997(a), makes the following Regulations:

Citation, commencement and interpretation

1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Greater London Magistrates’ Courts Authority
(Constitution) (Amendment) Regulations 2000 and shall come into force on 1st September
2000.

(2) In these Regulations “the 1999 Regulations” means the Greater London Magistrates’
Courts Authority (Constitution) Regulations 1999(b).

Amendments to the 1999 Regulations

2. In Schedule 4 to the 1999 Regulations—
(a) in paragraph 3(1)(a), for “27.4p” there shall be substituted “29.89p“;
(b) in paragraph 3(1)(b), for “36.8p” there shall be substituted “38.82p”;
(c) in paragraph 3(1)(c), for “1,401 cubic centimetres” there shall be substituted “1,400

cubic centimetres” and for “44.7p” there shall be substituted “48.43p”;
(d) in paragraph 3(2), for “23.6p” there shall be substituted “25.60p”;
(e) in paragraph 6(1)(a)(i), for “£6.57” there shall be substituted “£6.77”;
(f) in paragraph 6(1)(a)(ii), for “£9.16” there shall be substituted “£9.44”;
(g) in paragraph 6(1)(a)(iii), for “£17.29” there shall be substituted “£17.82”;
(h) in paragraph 6(1)(b), for “£77.43” there shall be substituted “£79.82” and for

“£88.31” there shall be substituted “£91.04”.

Signed by the authority of the Lord Chancellor

Jane Kennedy
Parliamentary Secretary,

Lord Chancellor’s Department3rd August 2000

a)( 1997 c. 25. Section 30B is inserted into the Justices of the Peace Act 1997 by section 83(1) of the Access to Justice Act
1999 (c. 22).

b)( S.I. 1999/3099.

1



15-08-00 02:44:55 PPSysB5419091001 Pag Table: STATIN Unit: PAG1

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations amend the Greater London Magistrates’ Courts Authority (Constitution)
Regulations 1999. The effect of the amendments is to increase the rates for travelling and
subsistence allowance payable to members of the Greater London Magistrates’ Courts
Authority.

£1.00
? Crown copyright 2000

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited
under the authority and superintendence of Carol Tullo, Controller of
Her Majesty’s Stationery Office and Queen’s Printer of Acts of Parliament.
E1551 8/2000 541909 19585

ISBN 0-11-099713-1

9 780110 997131


