
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1999 No. 1563

The National Lottery etc. Act 1993
(Amendment of Section 23) Order 1999

Amendment of section 23 of the National Lottery etc. Act 1993

2.—(1)  Subsection (2) of section 23 of the National Lottery etc. Act 1993(1) (the distributing
bodies) shall be amended in accordance with paragraphs (2) to (6) below.

(2)  In paragraph (a) (as to 83.3 per cent., for distribution by the English Sports Council) for “83.3
per cent.” there shall be substituted “75.6 per cent.”.

(3)  In paragraph (b) (as to 8.9 per cent., for distribution by the Scottish Sports Council) for “8.9
per cent.” there shall be substituted “8.1 per cent.”.

(4)  In paragraph (c) (as to 5 per cent., for distribution by the Sports Council for Wales) for “5
per cent.” there shall be substituted “4.5 per cent. ”.

(5)  In paragraph (d) (as to 2.8 per cent., for distribution by the Sports Council for Northern
Ireland) for “2.8 per cent.” there shall be substituted “ 2.6 per cent.”.

(6)  After paragraph (d) there shall be inserted–
“and

(e) as to 9.2 per cent., for distribution by the United Kingdom Sports Council.”.

(1) Section 23(2) of the National Lottery etc. Act 1993 was amended by the National Lottery etc. Act 1993 (Amendment of
Section 23) Order 1996 (S.I.1996/3095).

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/3095

