STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1987 No. 1512

NATIONAL HEALTH SERVICE, ENGLAND AND
WALES

The National Health Service (General Dental Services)
Amendment (No. 2) Regulations 1987

Made - - - - 24th August 1987
Laid before Parliament 2nd September 1987
Coming into force Ist October 1987

The Secretary of State for Social Services, in exercise of powers conferred on him by
sections 35(1), (4), 36(1) and 126(4) of the National Health Service Act 1977(a) and of
all other powers enabling him in that behalf, hereby makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the National Health Service (General Dental
Services) Amendment (No. 2) Regulations 1987 and shall come into force on 1st October
1987.

Amendment of regulations

2.—(1) The National Health Service (General Dental Services) Regulations 1973 (b)
shall be amended in accordance with the following provisions of this regulation.

(2) In regulation 26D (Amount and time of payments in consequence of suspension)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a)(i) for the amount “£1808” there shall be substituted the
amount “£1935”;

(b) in paragraph (1)(a)(ii) for the amount “£904” there shall be substituted the
amount “£967";

(c) in paragraph (1)(b)(i) for the amount “£904” there shall be substituted the
amount “£967";

(d) in paragraph (1)(b)(ii) for the amount “£1808” there shall be substituted the
amount “£1935” and

(e) in paragraph (2) for the amount ““£99,415” in both places where it occurs there
shall be substituted the amount “£107,103”.

(a) 1977 c.49; section 35(1) was substituted by the Family Practitioner Committees (Consequential Modifications)
Order 1985 (S.1. 1985/39), Article 7(9). Section 35(4) was added by section 15(a) of the Health and Social Services
and Social Security Adjudications Act 1983 (c.41). For amendments to section 35(3), see paragraph 8 of Schedule 5 to
the Dentists Act 1984 (c.24). Section 36 was amended by the Health and Social Security Act 1984 (c.48) Schedule 3,
paragraph 5. For the definition of “‘regulations™ see section 128(1) of the National Health Service Act 1977.

(b) S.I. 1973/1468; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1974/53, 1980/986, 1986/1499 and 1987/736.

[H87/1753)



(3) In Part I of Schedule 1 (terms of service for dentists) in paragraph 10A (preventive
treatment) after the words “‘topical fluoride preparations™ there shall be inserted the
words “‘or fissure sealants”.

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Social Services.
Edwina Currie
Parliamentary Under-Secretary of State,
24th August 1987 Department of Health and Social Security

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations amend the National Health Service (General Dental Services)
Regulations 1973, which concern arrangements under which dentists provide general
dental services under the National Health Service in England and Wales.

Regulation 2(2) of these Regulations increases the amounts of, and amounts used in
calculating, payments to dentists during periods of suspension of their registration under
the Dentists Act 1984 by an interim suspension order or a direction or order of the
Health Committee.

Regulation 2(3) of these Regulations enables dentists to provide as preventive
treatment the application of fissure sealants to persons under 16.

45p net
ISBN 0 11 077512 0

Printed in the United Kingdom for Her Majesty's Stationery Office

880/WO 1375 C300 9/87 4521 9385/9775/2113 PS 7944003



