2192

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1985 No. 832
ROAD TRAFFIC

The Heavy Goods Vehicles (Drivers’ Licences) (Amendment)
Regulations 1985

Made - - - - 30th May 1985
Laid before Parliament Tth June 1985
Coming into Operation Lst July 1985

The Secretary of State for Transport, in exercise of the powers conferred by
sections 119, 120(1) and 124 of the Road Traffic Act 1972(a), and now vested
in him(b), and of all other enabling powers, and after consultation with
representative organisations in accordance with the provisions of section 199(2)
of that Act, hereby makes the following Regulations:—

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Heavy Goods Vehicles (Drivers’
Licences) (Amendment) Regulations 1985 and shall come into operation on 1st
July 1985.

2. The Heavy Goods Vehicles (Drivers’ Licences) Regulations 1977(c) shall
be further amended as follows.

3. For Regulation 8 substitute the following Regulation:—

“Fees for licences

8. The fee for the grant of a provisional licence is £3 and the fee for the
grant of a full licence is £7.50”.

4. In Regulation 14 (Lost, defaced and exchanged licences)—
(1) in paragraph (1) for “£1.25” substitute “£1.50”; and
(2) in paragraph (3) for “£1.25” substitute “£1.50”.

5. Nothing in Regulations 3 and 4 of these Regulations shall apply where an
application for a licence (full, provisional, duplicate or exchange) was received
before 1st July 1985.

Nicholas Ridley,
Secretary of State for Transport.
30th May 198S5.

(a) 1972 c. 20; section 119 was amended by paragraph 10 of Schedule 1 to the Road Traffic
(Drivers’ Ages and Hours of Work) Act 1976 (c. 3).

(b) S.I. 1979/571 and 1981/238.

(¢) S.I. 1977/1309; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1980/1821, 1982/1174 and 1984/98.




S.1. 1985/832 2193

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This Note is not part of the Regulations.)

These Regulations further amend the Heavy Goods Vehicles (Drivers’
Licences) Regulations 1977 by increasing the fees for licences.

The fee for a provisional licence is increased from £2.50 tc £3, the fee for a
full licence is increased from £5.50 to £7.50 and the fee for a duplicate or
exchange licence is increased from £1.25 to £1.50. These increases apply where
an application is received on or after 1st July 1985.

SI 1985/832
ISBN 0-11-056832-X

L



	
	

