1005

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1985 No. 386
FEES AND CHARGES

The Measuring Instruments (EEC Initial Verification
Requirements) (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 1985

Made - - - - 11th March 1985
Laid before Parliament 15th March 1985
Coming into Operation 9th April 1985

The Secretary of State for Trade and Industry, with the consent of the Treasury,
in exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 56(1) and (2) of the
Finance Act 1973(a), and of all other powers enabling him in that behalf,
hereby makes the following Regulations:—

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Measuring Instruments (EEC Initial
Verification Requirements) (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 1985 and shall
come into operation on 9th April 1985.

2. The Measuring Instruments (EEC Initial Verification Requirements)
(Fees) Regulations 1982(b) are hereby amended as follows:—

(a) in Regulation 4—
(i) for “£12.60” there shall be substituted “£18.20’; and

(ii) at the end there shall be added *, except that when 10 or more
applications are made to the Secretary of State at the same time
then the fee payable shall be £14.60 in respect of each application”;

and

(b) in paragraph (a) of the Schedule, for “£26.90” there shall be substituted
“£31.25”.

Lucas of Chilworth,
Parliamentary Under-Secretary of State,

Department of Trade and Industry.
8th March 1985.

We consent.

Ian B. Lang,
Donald Thompson,
Two of the Lords Commissioners
of Her Majesty’s Treasury.
11th March 1985.

(a) 1973 ¢. 51. (b) S.I. 1982/811.




1006 FEES AND CHARGES

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This Note is not part of the Regulations.)

These Regulations amend the Measuring Instruments (EEC Initial Verifi-
cation Requirements) (Fees) Regulations 1982. They increase the amount
calculated at a rate of £26.90 per hour to £31.25 per hour in the fees payable
in connection with services provided by the Department of Trade and Industry
in respect of EEC initial verification of certain measuring instruments and
systems.

They also increase the single fee of £12.60 for services provided by the
Department of Trade and Industry in respect of EEC initial verification of all
classes of alcoholometers and alcohol hydrometers. The increase is to £18.20,
except that, when submitted in a batch of 10 or more applications, the increase
is to £14.60 each.

SI 1985/386
ISBN 0-11-056386-7

80110563862



	
	

