2018

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1983 No. 670
TELEGRAPHS

The Wireless Telegraphy (General Licence Charges)
(Amendment) Regulations 1983

Made - - - 29th April 1983
Laid before Parliament 10th May 1983
Coming into Operation Lst June 1983

The Secretary of State, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 2(1) of the
Wireless Telegraphy Act 1949(a) as enacted, and as extended by the Wireless
Telegraphy (Channel Islands) Order 1952(b) and the Wireless Telegraphy (Isle of
Man) Order 1952(c), and now vested in him (d), hereby, with the consent of the
Treasury, makes the following Regulations:—

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Wireless Telegraphy (General
Licence Charges) (Amendment) Regulations 1983 and shall come into operation
on 1st June 1983.

2. In these Regulations ‘“the principal Regulations” means the Wireless
Telegraphy (General Licence Charges) Regulations 1968(e).

3. Part I of the Schedule to the principal Regulations shall be amended as
follows:—

(a) for “£8.00” in all places where it occurs in the entries numbered 1A and
2A (Amateur Licences) there shall be substituted “£12.00”;

(b) for the entry numbered 5 (Demonstration Licence) there shall be
substituted the entry set out in Schedule 1 to these Regulations;

(c) for the entry numbered 9 (Private Mobile Radio Licence) there shall be
substituted the entry set out in Schedule 2 to these Regulations;

(d) for “£6.00” in all places where it occurs in the entries numbered 11,12 and
17 (Radar (Land) Station Licence; Radio Beacon Licence; Testing and
Development (Suppressed Radiation) Licence) there shall be substituted
“£7.00”;

(a) 1949 c.54. (b) S.1. 1952/1900. (¢) S.I. 1952/1899.
(d) 1969 c.48;S.1. 1969/1369, 1371, 1974/691.

(e) S.I. 1968/1314; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1976/2031, 1980/1850.



S.I. 1983/670 2019

(e) for “£18.60” in both places where it occurs in the entry numbered 14
(Radio Paging Licence) there shall be substituted ““£20.00”;

(f) for “£12.50” in all places where it occurs in the entries numbered 15, 16
and 18 (Ship (Receiving Only) Licence; Testing and Development
(Radiating) Licence; Training Establishment Licence) there shall be
substituted “£14.00”.

4. Part II of the Schedule to the principal Regulations shall be amended as
follows:—

(@) for “£8.00” in both places where it occurs in the entry numbered 1
(Aircraft Licence) there shall be substituted “£15.00”;

(b) for “£17.50” in both places where it occurs in the entry numbered 2 (Ship
Licence) there shall be substituted “£25.00”;

(¢) after the entry numbered 2 there shall be added the entry set out in
Schedule 3 to these Regulations.

5. Regulation 5(1) of the principal Regulations is hereby revoked.

W. S. I. Whitelaw,
One of Her Majesty’s Principal

Secretaries of State.
Home Office.
27th April 1983.
We consent to these Regulations.

P. L. Brooke,

D. J. F. Hunt,

Two of the Lords Commissioners of
Her Majesty’s Treasury.

29th April 1983.



2020

TELEGRAPHS

Regulation 3

SCHEDULE 1

ENTRY TO BE SUBSTITUTED FOR THE ENTRY NUMBERED 5 IN PART I OF THE SCHEDULE TO THE
PRINCIPAL REGULATIONS

5. Demon-
stration
Licence

A licence to establish and
use specified sending and
receiving stations for
wireless telegraphy for the
purpose of sending and
receiving, between the
stations, or between one
or some of the stations
and another or others

of them, spoken test
messages for demon-
strating the apparatus

comprised in the
stations in the course of
the licensee’s business as
manufacturer of or dealer
in such apparatus (not
being a licence
authorising the trans-
mission of messages
directly between base
stations).

Where the num-
ber of stations
comprised in the
licence does not
exceed 5

Where the said
number exceeds 5
but does not
exceed 10

Where the said
number exceeds
10 but does not
exceed 25

Where the said
number exceeds
25 but does not
exceed 40

Where the said
number exceeds
40 but does not
exceed 60

Where the said
number exceeds
60 but does not
exceed 80

Where the said
number exceeds
80 but does not
exceed 100

Where the said
number exceeds
100 but does not
exceed 120

Where the said
number exceeds
120 but does not
exceed 140 ...£1,120.00

Where the said
number exceeds
140 but does not
exceed 160 ...£1,280-00

Where the said
number exceeds
160 but does not
exceed 180 ...£1,440.00

Where the said

number exceeds

180 but does not

exceed 200 ...£1,600-00
plus £8 for each
additional station

in excess of 200

£60-00

£80-00

£200-00

£320-00

£480-00

£640-00

£800-00

£960-00

Where the num-
ber of stations
comprised in the
licence does not
exceed 5

Where the said
number exceeds 5
but does not
exceed 10

Where the said
number exceeds
10 but does not
exceed 25

Where the said
number exceeds
25 but does not
exceed 40

Where the said
number exceeds
40 but does not
exceed 60

Where the said
number exceeds
60 but does not
exceed 80

Where the said
number exceeds
80 but does not
exceed 100

Where the said
number exceeds
100 but does not
exceed 120

Where the said
number exceeds
120 but does not
exceed 140 ...£1,120.00

Where the said
number exceeds
140 but does not
exceed 160 ...£1,280-00

Where the said
number exceeds
160 but does not
exceed 180 ...£1,440.00

Where the said

number exceeds

180 but does not

exceed 200 ...£1,600.00
plus £8 for each
additional station

in excess of 200

£60-00

£80-00

£200-00

£320-00

£480-00

£640-00

£800-00

£960-00




S.I. 1983/670

2021

SCHEDULE 2

Regulation 3

ENTRY TO BE SUBSTITUTED FOR THE ENTRY NUMBERED 9 IN PART I OF THE SCHEDULE TO THE
PRINCIPAL REGULATIONS

9. Private
Mobile
Radio
Licence

A licence to establish and
use, on specified fre-
quencies not being below
30 megacycles a second,

specified sending and
receiving  stations for
wireless telegraphy
(whether or not the

licence also authorises the
establishment and use of
receiving stations for
wireless telegraphy for the
purpose of monitoring
messages sent between the
stations) for the purpose
of sending and receiving
spoken messages con-
cerning the business of the
licensee  between the
stations, or between one
or some of the stations,
and another or others of
them (not being a licence
authorising the trans-
mission of messages
which are originated at
one base station direct to
another base station and
which are not messages
intended for onward
transmission by that other
base station to a mobile
station).

Where the num-
ber of mobile
stations com-
prised in the
licence does not
exceed 5

Where the said
number exceeds 5
but does not
exceed 10

Where the said
number exceeds
10 but does not
exceed 25

Where the said
number exceeds
25 but does not
exceed 40

Where the said
number exceeds
40 but does not
exceed 60

Where the said
number exceeds
60 but does not
exceed 80

Where the said
number exceeds
80 but does not
exceed 100

Where the said
number exceeds
100 but does not
exceed 120

Where the said
number exceeds
120 but does not
exceed 140 ...£1,120-00

Where the said
number exceeds
140 but does not
exceed 160 ...£1,280-00

Where the said
number exceeds
160 but does not
exceed 180 ...£1,440.00

Where the said

number exceeds

180 but does not

exceed 200 ...£1,600.00
plus £8 for each
additional station

in excess of 200

£60-00

£80-00

£200-00

£320-00

£480-00

£640-00

£800-00

£960-00

Where the num-
ber of mobile
stations com-
prised in the
licence does not
exceed 5

Where the said
number exceeds 5
but does not
exceed 10

Where the said
number exceeds
10 but does not
exceed 25

Where the said
number exceeds
25 but does not
exceed 40

Where the said
number exceeds
40 but does not
exceed 60

Where the said
number exceeds
60 but does not
exceed 80

Where the said
number exceeds
80 but does not
exceed 100

Where the said
number exceeds
100 but does not
exceed 120

Where the said
number exceeds
120 but does not
exceed 140 ...£1,120.00

Where the said
number exceeds
140 but does not
exceed 160 ...£1,280-00

Where the said
number exceeds
160 but does not
exceed 180 ...£1,440.00

Where the said

number exceeds

180 but does not

exceed 200 ... £1,600-00
plus £8 for each
additional station

in excess of 200

£60-00

£80-00

£200-00

£320-00

£480-00

£640-00

£800-00

£960-00




2022 TELEGRAPHS

Regulation 4 SCHEDULE 3

ENTRY TO BE ADDED AFTER THE ENTRY NUMBERED 2 IN PART II OF THE SCHEDULE TO THE
PRINCIPAL REGULATIONS

3. Ship A licence to establish and £15.00 £15.00

Licence | use a sending and
(VHF) | receiving station for
wireless telegraphy in a
ship for the purpose of (a)
sending on specified VHF
frequencies only messages
to coast stations, ship
stations and  aircraft
stations and (b) receiving
messages sent from coast
stations, ship stations,
aircraft stations, special
service stations and radio-
navigation stations for
general reception by ship
stations or for reception
by the said station, and
messages sent by
authorised broadcasting
stations— whether or not
the licence in addition
authorises the establish-
ment and use of stations
for wireless telegraphy in
lifeboats or other
survival-craft associated
with or normally carried
by the ship, or of a radar
station  for  wireless
telegraphy in the ship.

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This Note is not part of the Regulations.)

These Regulations alter the fees payable on the issue and renewal of certain
wireless telegraphy licences. Apart from the Ship (Receiving Only) Licence all the
licences concerned authorise the sending and receiving of messages.

Schedule 1 to the Regulations provides that in place of the fee of £18-60 for each
station licensed by a Demonstration Licence there shall be fees calculated
according to a scale based on multiples of stations. Schedule 2 revises the fees for
Private Mobile Radio Licences, which are already based on a similar scale.

Schedule 3 sets at £15 the fee payable on the issue and renewal of a Ship Licence
which authorises transmission on VHF frequencies only.



SI
IS

i



	
	
	
	
	
	

