4066,

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1976 No. 1595
POLICE

The Police Cadets (Amendment) Regulations 1976

Made - - - 27th September 1976
Laid before Parliament 6th October 1976
Coming into Operation Lst November 1976

In exercise of the powers conferred on me by section 35 of the Police Act
1964(a), and after consulting the Police Council for the United Kingdom in
accordance with section 4(4) of the Police Act 1969(b), I hereby make the
following Regulations:—

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Police Cadets (Amendment)
Regulations 1976.

2. These Regulations shall come into operation on 1st November 1976 and
shall have effect—

(a) for the purposes of Regulation 4(1) thereof, as from that date;

(b) for the purposes of Regulation 4(2) thereof, as from 1st January 1976;
(¢) for the purposes of Regulation 5 thereof, as from 1st April 1976;

(d) for the purposes of Regulation 6 thereof, as from 1st July 1975.

3. In these Regulations any reference to the principal Regulations is a
reference to the Police Cadets Regulations 1968(c), as amended(d).

4.—(1) In paragraph (1) of Regulation 14 of the principal Regulations
(travel allowances) for the sum “£0-40” there shall be substituted the sum
“£0-50”.

(2) In paragraph (2) of the said Regulation 14 for the sum “£15” there shall
be substituted the sum “£36”.

5. In Regulation 15(1A) of the principal Regulations (footwear allowance)
for the sum “£0-29” there shall be substituted the sum *£0-35”.

(a) 1964 c. 48. (b) 1969 c. 63.

(c) S.I. 1968/25 (1968 1, p. 31).

(d) The relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1969/408, 1971/151, 1972/706, 1974/1153,
1975/1361 (1969 1, p. 1150; 19711, p.432; 197211, p. 2263; 197411, p. 4398; 197511, p. 4636).



S.1. 1976/1595 4067

6. For the Table in Schedule 1 to the principal Regulations (scales of pay)
there shall be substituted the following Table:—

“TABLE
City of London and
Age metropolitan police forces Other police forces
Under 17 years £1,328 a year £1,137 a year
17 years £1,397 a year £1,206 a year
18 years £1,535 a year £1,344 a year
19 years £1,571 a year £1,380 a year .

Merlyn Rees,

One of Her Majesty’s Principal
Secretaries of State.
Home Office,
Whitehall.

27th September 1976.

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This Note is not part of the Regulations.)

These Regulations amend the Police Cadets Regulations 1968 with effect
from the dates mentioned below (retrospective effect is authorised by
section 33(4), as applied by section 35(2), of the Police Act 1964).

Regulation 4 relates to travel allowances to visit a parent or guardian.
Paragraph (1) provides, with effect from 1st November 1976, that such an
allowance shall only be payable where the cost of the return journey exceeds
£0-50 (instead of £0-40). Paragraph (2) provides, with effect from 1st January
1976, that the maximum allowance payable in respect of a return journey to a
place outside the British Isles shall not exceed £36 (instead of £15).

Regulation 5, with effect from 1st April 1976, increases the amount of a
footwear allowance from £0-29 to £0-35 a week.

Regulation 6, with effect from 1st July 1975, increases by £26 the annual pay
of a cadet attached to the City of London or metropolitan police force.






SI 1976/1595
ISBN 0-11-061595-6

80110615950



	
	
	
	

