2989

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1976 No. 1113
ROAD TRAFFIC

The Public Service Vehicles (Licences and Certificates)
' (Amendment) Regulations 1976

Made - - - - 16th July 1976
Laid before Parliament 23rd July 1976
Coming into Operation 13th August 1976

The Secretary of State for the Environment in exercise of the powers conferred
by sections 159 and 160 of the Road Traffic Act 1960(a), and now vested in him(b),
and of all other enabling powers, and after consultation with representative
organisations in accordance with section 260(2) of that Act, hereby makes the
following Regulations:—

1. These Regulations shall come into operation on 13th August 1976
and may be cited as the Public Service Vehicles (Licences and Certificates)
(Amendment) Regulations 1976.

2. The Public Service Vehicles (Licences and Certificates) Regulations 1952(c), '
as amended(d) shall be further amended so as to have effect as if—

(a) in Regulation 17(Fees), in paragraph (1) for the words “£12 10s” there
were substituted the words “£45”;

(b) in Regulation 24(Fees), for the words “£6 10s” there were substituted the
words “£25”’; and

(c) in Regulation 44(Fees), for the words “£1” there were substituted the

words “£4”.
John Gilbert,
Signed by authority of the Minister for Transport,
Secretary of State. Department of the Environment.

16th July 1976.

(a) 1960 c. 16. () S.I. 1970/1681 (1970 I1I, p. 5551).
(©) S.I. 1952/900 (1952 III, p. 2907).
9(il) Tl;t;)relevant amending instruments are:- S.I. 1957/1118, 1969/32 (1957 II, p. 1938;
1969 1, p. 91).



2990 ROAD TRAFFIC

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This Note is not part of the Regulations.)
These Regulations further amend the Public Service Vehicles (Licences and
Certificates) Regulations 1952 so as to increase—
(i) the fee for a public service vehicle licence from £12-50 to £45
(Regulation 2(a));
(ii) the fee for a certificate of fitness from £6-50 to £25 (Regulation 2(b));
and

(iii) the fee for a road service licence from £1 to £4 for each year or part
of a year for which it is to have effect (Regulation 2(c)).

SI 1976/1113
ISBN 0-11-061113-6

BIJ].].EI“E.].].LBE.



	
	

