3000

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1974 No. 769 (S.67)
. EDUCATION, SCOTLAND

The Teachers Superannuation (Contributions) (Scotland)
Regulations 1974

Made - - - 25th April 1974
Laid before Parliament 9th May 1974
Coming into Operation 29th May 1974

In exercise of the powers conferred on me by section 9 of the Superannuation
Act 1972(a) and of all other powers enabling me in that behalf, with the
consent of the Minister for the Civil Service and after consultation with repre-
sentatives of education authorities and of teachers and with such representatives
of other persons likely to be affected as appear to me to be appropriate, 1
hereby make the following regulations:—

Citation, commencement and interpretation

1.—(1) These regulations may be cited as the Teachers Superannuation
(Contributions) (Scotland) Regulations 1974 and shall be included among the
regulations which may be cited together as the Teachers Superannuation (Scot-
land) Regulations 1969 to 1974.

(2) These regulations shall come into operation on 29th May 1974 and shall
take effect as from 1st April 1974.

(3) The Interpretation Act 1889(b) shall apply for the interpretation of these
regulations as it applies for the interpretation of an Act of Parliament.

Alteration in contributions

2. The Teachers Superannuation (Financial Provisions) (Scotland) Regula-
tions 1972(c) as amended (d) shall have effect with the substitution—

(a) In regulation 5(2) (teacher’s contribution). for the words “6} per cent”
of the words “6 per cent”;

(b) In regulation 5(3) (employer’s contribution). for the words “6% per
cent” of the words “6 per cent”; and

(¢) In regulation 7A (2) (balance of the new entrant contribution), for the
words “13 per cent” of the words “12 per cent”.

(a) 1972 c. 11. (b) 1889 c. 63.
(c) S.I. 1972/551 (1972 1, p. 1855). (d) S.I. 1972/1239 (1972 11, p. 3738).



S.I. 1974/769 3001

William Ross,
One of Her Majesty’s Principal
Secretaries of State.

St. Andrew’s House,
Edinburgh.

25th April 1974,

Consent of the Minister for the Civil Service given under his Official Seal
on 25th April 1974,

K. H. McNeill,
(L.s.)

Authorised by the Minister
for the Civil Service.

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This Note is not part of the Regulations.)

These Regulations reduce the rate at which contributions are payable by
teachers under the Teachers Superannuation (Scotland) Regulations 1969 to
1974 and make consequential amendments to the provisions specifying the
contributions payable by employers. By virtue of section 12(1) of the Super-

annuation Act 1972 these Regulations have retrospective effect to Ist April
1974,

SI 1974/769
ISBN 0-11-040769-5

40110407692



	
	

