5040

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1973 No. 1601
JURIES

The Jurors’ Allowances (Amendment No. 2)

Regulations 1973

Made - - - 19th September 1973

Coming into Operation 22nd October 1973

The Lord Chancellor, in exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 1
of the Juries Act 1949(a), as amended by section 1 of the Juries Act 1954(b),
section 36 of the Courts Act 1971(c) and section 27 of the Criminal Justice
Act 1972(d), and with the consent of the Minister for the Civil Service, hereby
makes the following Regulations:—

1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Jurors’ Allowances
(Amendment No. 2) Regulations 1973 and shall come into operation
on 22nd October 1973.

(2) In these Regulations “the principal Regulations” means the Jurors’
Allowances Regulations 1972(e), as amended(f).

2. Regulation 4 of the principal Regulations shall be amended as follows: —

(a) in paragraph 2(a), for the expression “57p” there shall be substituted
the expression “62p”;

(b) in paragraph 2(b), for the expression “£1-25” there shall be substituted
the expression “£1:35”;

(¢) in paragraph 2(c), for the expression “£2-20” there shall be substituted
the expression “£2:40”;

(d) in paragraph 2(d), for the expression “£3-12” there shall be substituted
the expression “£3-40”;

(e) in paragraph 2(e), for the expression “£3-75” there shall be substituted
the expression “£4-05”; and

(f) in paragraph 3, for the expression “£8” there shall be substituted the
expression “£8-65”.

(a) 1949 c. 27. (b) 1954 c. 41. (c) 1971 c. 23.
@) 1972 c. 71. (e) S.I. 1972/1976 (1972 III, p. 5889).
(f) There are no relevant amendments.




S.I1. 1973/1601 5041

3. The Schedule to the principal Regulations shall be amended as follows : —

(@) in paragraph 3(2), for the expression “2-6p” there shall be substituted
the expression “2-7p”;

(b) in paragraph 3(2)(i), for the expression “4-1p” there shall be substituted
the expression “4-4p”;

(c) in paragraph 3(2)ii), for the expression “5-1p” there shall be sub-
stituted the expression “5-5p”; and

(d) in paragraph 3(2)(iii), for the expression “5-6p” there shall be sub-
stituted the expression “6-:0p”.

Dated 18th September 1973.

Hailsham of St. Marylebone, C.

Consent of the Minister for the Civil Service given under his official seal
on 19th September 1973.

J. C. Leeming,

(L.s.)
Authorised by the Minister
for the Civil Service.

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This Note is not part of the Regulations.)

These Regulations provide for increases in the rates of subsistence allow-
ance payable to jurors and to the rates of travelling allowance payable where
a juror travels by private motor car.

SI 1973/1601
ISBN 0-11-031601-0

80110 316017



	
	

