
National Insurance 
Contributions 

(Reduction in Rates) 
Act 2024 

CHAPTER 5 

Explanatory Notes have been produced to assist in the 
understanding of this Act and are available separately 

£5.78





National Insurance Contributions 
(Reduction in Rates) Act 2024 

CHAPTER 5 

CONTENTS 

1 Reduction in rates 
2 Annual maximum contributions 
3 Commencement and short title 





c. 5 CHARLES III 

National Insurance Contributions 
(Reduction in Rates) Act 2024 

2024 CHAPTER 5 

An Act to make provision for and in connection with reducing the main 
rates of primary Class 1 national insurance contributions and Class 4 

[20th March 2024] national insurance contributions. 

B E IT ENACTED by the King’s most Excellent Majesty, by and with the advice and 
consent of the Lords Spiritual and Temporal, and Commons, in this present 

Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as follows:— 

1 Reduction in rates 

(1) In the following provisions— 
(a) section 8(2)(a) of the Social Security Contributions and Benefits Act 

1992 (main primary percentage for Great Britain), and 
(b) section 8(2)(a) of the Social Security Contributions and Benefits 

(Northern Ireland) Act 1992 (main primary percentage for Northern 
Ireland), 

for “10%” substitute “8%”. 

(2) In regulation 131 of the Social Security (Contributions) Regulations 2001 
(reduced rate of primary Class 1 contributions otherwise payable at the main 
primary percentage), for “3.85%” substitute “1.85%”. 

(3) In the following provisions (as they had effect immediately before the day 
on which this Act comes into force)— 

(a) section 15(3ZA)(a) of the Social Security Contributions and Benefits 
Act 1992 (main Class 4 percentage for Great Britain), and 

(b) section 15(3ZA)(a) of the Social Security Contributions and Benefits 
(Northern Ireland) Act 1992 (main Class 4 percentage for Northern 
Ireland), 

for “9 per cent” substitute “6%”. 



(4) Section 2 of the National Insurance Contributions (Reduction in Rates) Act 
2023 is superseded by subsection (3) and accordingly is to be treated as never 
having had effect. 

2 Annual maximum contributions 

(1) The Social Security (Contributions) Regulations 2001 (as they had effect 
immediately before the day on which this Act comes into force) are amended 
as follows. 

(2) In regulation 21 (annual maxima for those with more than one employment), 
in paragraph (2), in Step Two, for “11.5%” substitute “8%”. 

(3) In regulation 100 (annual maximum of Class 4 contributions), in paragraph 
(3)— 

(a) in Step Two, for “9 per cent” substitute “6%”, and 
(b) in Step Five, for “100/9” substitute “100/6”. 

(4) Paragraph 3 of the Schedule to the National Insurance Contributions 
(Reduction in Rates) Act 2023 is superseded by this section and accordingly 
is to be treated as never having had effect. 

3 Commencement and short title 

(1) This Act comes into force on 6 April 2024. 

(2) This Act may be cited as the National Insurance Contributions (Reduction in 
Rates) Act 2024. 

National Insurance Contributions (Reduction in Rates) Act 2024 (c. 5) 2 

  
? Crown copyright 2024

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Jeff James, 
Controller of His Majesty’s Stationery Office and King’s Printer of Acts of Parliament.



Published by TSO (The Stationery Office), a Williams Lea company, 
and available from:

Online
www.tsoshop.co.uk

Mail, Telephone & E-mail
TSO
PO Box 29, Norwich, NR3 1GN
Telephone orders/General enquiries: 0333 202 5070
E-mail: customer.services@tso.co.uk
Textphone: 0333 202 5077 � ������ ���	�	


����������������	��	


	1 - Reduction in rates
	2 - Annual maximum contributions
	3 - Commencement and short title



